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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 04/23/2008
* % * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 08:12
PS&E JOB NO : 07A809 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : May 21 2008
CONTRACT NO : 007538 REGION NO  :1 AWARDED ON : May 27 2008
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2613
Y I LOW BIDDER  —ccmmoe  —mmmmem 2ND BIDDER  —————ee
TITLE :1-5 C.A. CAREY CORP. GRANITE NORTHWEST, INC. DBA
@g§$gTD§T Tﬁo?ngﬁkEZsST - SB I-5 537 NW LOCUST ST 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE
07A809 (REV. 4/23/08) 98027-2412
PROJECT ISSAQUAH WA 980271006 EVERETT WA 982011927
CONTY(S) - KING CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100134 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000
ENGR™S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
PREPARATION
1 MOBILIZATION
L.S. -6.43% 1.81%
448,875.00 420,000.00 -28,875.00 457,000.00 8,125.00
2 CLEARING AND GRUBBING
0.1000 ACRE 25,000.0000 50,000.0000 100.00 % 20,000.0000 ~20.00%
2,500.00 5,000.00 2,500.00 2,000.00 -500.00
3 REMOVAL OF STRUCTURE AND OBSTRUCTION
L.S. 614.29% 500.36%
2,100.00 15,000.00  12,900.00 12,607.50  10,507.50
4 REMOVING NOISE BARRIER WALL SHAFT OBSTRUCTIONS
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
3,000.00 3,000.00 3,000.00
5 REMOVING PORTION OF EXISTING STRUCTURE - RETAINING WALL E
L.S. _59.44% —44_44Y
180,000.00 73,000.00 -107,000.00 100,000.00  -80,000.00
6 REMOVING PORTION OF EXISTING STRUCTURE - RETAINING WALL B
L.S. 16.67% -25.00%
12,000.00 14,000.00 2,000.00 9,000.00  -3,000.00
7 REMOVING PAINT LINE
5610.0000 L.F. 2.0000 0.6000 ~70.00% 0.5500 ~72.50%
11,220.00 3,366.00 -7,854.00 3,085.50  -8,134.50
8 REMOVING PLASTIC LINE
10.0000 L.F. 2.0000 5.0000 150.00 % 20.0000 900.00 %
20.00 50.00 30.00 200.00 180.00
9 REMOVING PLASTIC TRAFFIC MARKING
4.0000 EACH 50.0000 120.0000 140.00% 61.0000 22.00%
200.00 480.00 280.00 244.00 44.00
10 REMOVING PLASTIC CROSSWALK LINE
90.0000 S.F. 2.0000 4.0000 100.00 % 2.5000 25.00 %
180.00 360.00 180.00 225.00 45.00
11  REMOVING LUMINAIRE AND BRACKET ARM
11.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 400.0000 -60.00% 800.0000 ~20.00%
11,000.00 4,400.00 -6,600.00 8,800.00  -2,200.00
12 REMOVING SIGNALIZATION (LYNN/BOYLSTON)
L.S. -10.00% -35.00%
10,000.00 9,000.00  -1,000.00 6,500.00  -3,500.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 04/23/2008
* % * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 08:12
PS&E JOB NO : 07A809 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : May 21 2008
CONTRACT NO : 007538 REGION NO -1 AWARDED ON : May 27 2008
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2613
iy sr 005 T e LOW BIDDER  ——=-=-= ——————m 2ND BIDDER  —————ev
TITLE 11-5 C.A. CAREY CORP. GRANITE NORTHWEST, INC. DBA
ﬁgg$gTD§T—TSO?SEH5kEZSST - SB 1-5 537 NW LOCUST ST 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE
07A809 (REV. 4/23/08) 98027-2412
PROJECT ISSAQUAH WA 980271006 EVERETT WA 982011927
COUNTY(S) - KING CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100134 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF.
GRADING
13 ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL
1110.0000 C.Y. 40.0000 50.0000 25.00% 0.0100 -99.98%
44.,400.00 55,500.00  11,100.00 11.10 -44,388.90
STRUCTURE
14 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS A INCL. HAUL
609.0000 C.Y. 50.0000 100.0000 100.00 % 0.0100 -99.98%
30,450.00 60,900.00  30,450.00 6.09 -30,443.91
15 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A — NOISE WALL E
L.S. -80.00% -52.00%
75,000.00 15,000.00 -60,000.00 36,000.00 -39,000.00
16 ST. REINF. BAR FOR NOISE BARRIER WALL FOOTING
17500.0000 LB. 1.5000 3.0000 100.00 % 2.3000 53.33%
26,250.00 52,500.00  26,250.00 40,250.00  14,000.00
17 CONC. CLASS 4000 FOR NOISE BARRIER WALL FOOTING
2420000 C.Y. 1,000.0000 1,350.0000 35.00% 750.0000 -25.00%
242,000.00 326,700.00  84,700.00 181,500.00 -60,500.00
18 DEFICIENT STRENGTH CONC. PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00%
~3.00 ~3.00 -3.00
19 NOISE BARRIER WALL TYPE 4 MODIFIED (20 IN. SHAFT)
6780.0000 S.F. 60.0000 95.0000 58.33% 98.0000 63.33%
406,800.00 644,100.00 237,300.00 664,440.00 257,640.00
20 NOISE BARRIER WALL ACCESS DOOR
3.0000 EACH 4,000.0000 5,800.0000 45.00% 110.0000 -97.25%
12,000.00 17,400.00 5,400.00 330.00 -11,670.00
21 NOISE BARRIER WALL E PRECAST CONC. PANEL
10200.0000 S.F. 40.0000 62.0000 55.00 % 55.0000 37.50%
408,000.00 632,400.00 224,400.00 561,000.00 153,000.00
22 PERMANENT GROUND ANCHOR
124.0000 EACH 3,500.0000 3,335.0000 —4.71% 3,000.0000 ~14.29%
434,000.00 413,540.00 -20,460.00 372,000.00 -62,000.00
23 PERMANENT GROUND ANCHOR PERFORMANCE TEST
7.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 600.0000 ~40.00% 500.0000 -50.00%
7,000.00 4,200.00 -2,800.00 3,500.00  -3,500.00
24 APPLYING PIGMENTED SEALER TO EXISTING CONCRETE SURFACE
2910.0000 S.Y. 10.0000 7.0000 ~30.00% 5.5000 —45.00%
29,100.00 20,370.00  -8,730.00 16,005.00 -13,095.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 04/23/2008
* % * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 08:12

PS&E JOB NO : 07A809 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : May 21 2008

CONTRACT NO : 007538 REGION NO  :1 AWARDED ON : May 27 2008

VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2613

e I LOW BIDDER  ——-—--= ——————- 2ND BIDDER  ——-———-

TITLE :1-5 C.A. CAREY CORP. GRANITE NORTHWEST, INC. DBA

BOSTON ST TO E SHELBY ST - SB I-5
WESTSIDE - NOISE WALLS

537 NW LOCUST ST 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE

07A809 (REV. 4/23/08) 98027-2412
PROJECT ISSAQUAH WA 980271006 EVERETT WA 982011927
COUNTY(S) - KING CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100134 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT  AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT  AMT.DIFF.
STRUCTURE
25  PLANTER BOX TYPE 1
L.S. 276.67% 170.00%
3,000.00 11,300.00  8,300.00 8,100.00 5,100.00
26 PLANTER BOX TYPE 2
L.S. 183.33% 46.67%
15,000.00 42,500.00  27,500.00 22,000.00 7,000.00
SURFACING
27 CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE
120.0000 c.v. 50.0000 85.0000 70.00% 72.0000 44.00%
6,000.00 10,200.00  4,200.00 8,640.00 2,640.00
LIQUID ASPHALT
28 ANTI-STRIPPING ADDITIVE
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
440.00 440.00 440.00
CEMENT CONCRETE PAVEMENT
29 CEMENT CONC. PAVEMENT
2450000 c.v. 200.0000 420.0000 110.00% 475.0000 137.50%
49,000.00 102,900.00  53,900.00 116,375.00  67,375.00
HOT MIX ASPHALT
30 PLANING BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT
1220.0000 s.v. 10.0000 10.0000 0.00% 10.0000 0.00%
12,200.00 12,200.00 0.00 12,200.00 0.00
31 HVWA CL. 1/2 IN. PG 64-22
440.0000 TON 80.0000 105.0000 31.25% 130.0000 62.50%
35,200.00 46,200.00  11,000.00 57,200.00  22,000.00
32 JOB MIX COMPLIANCE PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00%
1,060.00 1,060.00 1,060.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 04/23/2008
* % * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 08:12
PS&E JOB NO : 07A809 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : May 21 2008
CONTRACT NO : 007538 REGION NO -1 AWARDED ON : May 27 2008
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2613
iy sr 005 T e LOW BIDDER  ——=-=-= ——————m 2ND BIDDER  —————ev
TITLE 11-5 C.A. CAREY CORP. GRANITE NORTHWEST, INC. DBA
ﬁgg$gTD§T Tﬁo?ngﬁkEZsST - SB 1-5 537 NW LOCUST ST 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE
07A809 (REV. 4/23/08) 98027-2412
PROJECT : ISSAQUAH WA 980271006 EVERETT WA 982011927
COUNTY(S) - KING CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100134 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF.
HOT MIX ASPHALT
33 COMPACTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00%
710.00 710.00 710.00
EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING
34 ESC LEAD
180.0000 DAY 125.0000 75.0000 ~40.00% 0.0100 -99.99%
22,500.00 13,500.00  -9,000.00 1.80 -22,498.20
35 STREET CLEANING
450.0000 HR 150.0000 140.0000 ~6.67% 140.0000 ~6.67%
67,500.00 63,000.00  -4,500.00 63,000.00  -4,500.00
36 INLET PROTECTION
18.0000 EACH 90.0000 70.0000 _22.22% 110.0000 22.229%
1,620.00 1,260.00 -360.00 1,980.00 360.00
37 SILT FENCE
10.0000 L.F. 5.0000 12.0000 140.00 % 6.0000 20.00%
50.00 120.00 70.00 60.00 10.00
38 EROSION/WATER POLLUTION CONTROL
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
75,000.00 75,000.00 75,000.00
39 SEEDING, FERTILIZING, AND MULCHING
0.1000 ACRE 15,000.0000 7,000.0000 -53.33% 12,000.0000 -20.00%
1,500.00 700.00 -800.00 1,200.00 -300.00
40 TOPSOIL TYPE A
5.0000 C.Y. 125.0000 78.0000 -37.60% 130.0000 4.00%
625.00 390.00 ~235.00 650.00 25.00
41 PSIPE SAGE LEAF ROCKROSE, #1 CONT., 9" HT.
55.0000 EACH 25.0000 22.0000 ~12.00% 35.0000 40.00%
1,375.00 1,210.00 -165.00 1,925.00 550.00
42 PSIPE BIOKOVO GERANIUM, 4" POT, 3" HT
77.0000 EACH 10.0000 14.0000 40.00% 25.0000 150.00 %
770.00 1,078.00 308.00 1,925.00 1,155.00
43 PSIPE BOSTON IVY "VETCHII®, #1 CONT., 4 RUNNERS, 10" MIN.
47.0000 EACH 15.0000 22.0000 46.67% 35.0000 133.33%
705.00 1,034.00 329.00 1,645.00 940.00

44 PLANT ESTABLISHMENT - SECOND YEAR
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
6,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 04/23/2008
* % * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 08:12
PS&E JOB NO : 07A809 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : May 21 2008
CONTRACT NO : 007538 REGION NO -1 AWARDED ON : May 27 2008
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2613
iy sr 005 T e LOW BIDDER  ——=-=-= ——————m 2ND BIDDER  —————ev
TITLE 11-5 C.A. CAREY CORP. GRANITE NORTHWEST, INC. DBA
ﬁgg$gTD§T—TSO?SEH5kEZSST - SB 1-5 537 NW LOCUST ST 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE
07A809 (REV. 4/23/08) 98027-2412
PROJECT ISSAQUAH WA 980271006 EVERETT WA 982011927
COUNTY(S) - KING CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100134 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF.
EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING
45 PLANT ESTABLISHMENT - THIRD YEAR
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
6,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00
46 COARSE COMPOST
1.3000 c.Y 125.0000 60.0000 -52.00% 150.0000 20.00%
162.50 78.00 _84.50 195.00 32.50
47 WEED CONTROL
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
1,000.00 1,000.00 1,000.00
48 SOIL AMENDMENT
4.0000 c.Y 125.0000 80.0000 -36.00% 140.0000 12.00%
500.00 320.00 ~180.00 560.00 60.00
49 BARK OR WOOD CHIP MULCH
4.5000 C.Y. 125.0000 60.0000 _52.00% 100.0000 ~20.00%
562.50 270.00 -292.50 450.00 ~112.50
TRAFFIC
50 CEMENT CONC. TRAFFIC CURB
110.0000 L.F. 30.0000 35.0000 16.67% 31.0000 3.33%
3,300.00 3,850.00 550.00 3,410.00 110.00
51  CEMENT CONC. CURB TYPE 410C
1400.0000 L.F. 30.0000 18.0000 ~40.00% 16.0000 _46.67%
42,000.00 25,200.00 -16,800.00 22,400.00 -19,600.00
52 TYPE C PRECAST TRAFFIC CURB
760.0000 L.F. 40.0000 20.0000 -50.00% 18.0000 _55.00%
30,400.00 15,200.00 -15,200.00 13,680.00 -16,720.00
53 BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE 1A
2.0000 EACH 2,500.0000 2,850.0000 14.00% 2,400.0000 ~4.00%
5,000.00 5,700.00 700.00 4,800.00 -200.00
54 PERMANENT IMPACT ATTENUATOR
2.0000 EACH 8,000.0000 27,000.0000 237.50% 23,000.0000 187.50%
16,000.00 54,000.00  38,000.00 46,000.00  30,000.00
55 PAINT LINE
5515.0000 L.F. 1.0000 0.4000 ~60.00% 0.6000 ~40.00%
5,515.00 2,206.00 -3,309.00 3,309.00  -2,206.00
56 PLASTIC LINE
200.0000 L.F. 2.0000 1.2000 ~40.00% 3.0000 50.00 %
400.00 240.00 ~160.00 600.00 200.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 04/23/2008
* % * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 08:12
PS&E JOB NO : 07A809 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : May 21 2008
CONTRACT NO : 007538 REGION NO -1 AWARDED ON : May 27 2008
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2613
iy sr 005 T e LOW BIDDER  ——=-=-= ——————m 2ND BIDDER  —————ev
TITLE 11-5 C.A. CAREY CORP. GRANITE NORTHWEST, INC. DBA
ﬁgg$gTD§T Tﬁo?ngﬁkEZsST - SB 1-5 537 NW LOCUST ST 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE
07A809 (REV. 4/23/08) 98027-2412
PROJECT ISSAQUAH WA 980271006 EVERETT WA 982011927
COUNTY(S) - KING CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100134 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF.
TRAFFIC
57 PLASTIC WIDE LINE
220.0000 L.F 2.0000 2.4000 20.00% 3.0000 50.00 %
440.00 528.00 88.00 660.00 220.00
58 PLASTIC CROSSWALK LINE
192.0000 S.F 10.0000 4.0000 ~60.00% 5.0000 -50.00%
1,920.00 768.00  -1,152.00 960.00 -960.00
59 PLASTIC STOP LINE
20.0000 L.F 20.0000 12.0000 ~40.00% 11.0000 —45.00%
400.00 240.00 ~160.00 220.00 -180.00
60 PLASTIC TRAFFIC ARROW
10.0000 EACH 130.0000 90.0000 -30.77% 100.0000 _23.08%
1,300.00 900.00 ~400.00 1,000.00 -300.00
61 PERMANENT SIGNING
L.S. 33.33% 100.00 %
7,500.00 10,000.00 2,500.00 15,000.00 7,500.00
62 ILLUMINATION SYSTEM REVISION, SUA647
L.S. 59.09 % 13.64%
8,800.00 14,000.00 5,200.00 10,000.00 1,200.00
63 ILLUMINATION SYSTEM REVISION, SUA634
L.S. 38.33% 33.33%
6,000.00 8,300.00 2,300.00 8,000.00 2,000.00
64  SIGNAL HEAD, VEHICLE 3 SECTION 1-WAY
5.0000 EACH 1,200.0000 1,700.0000 41.67% 2,000.0000 66.67 %
6,000.00 8,500.00 2,500.00 10,000.00 4,000.00
65  SIGNAL HEAD, VEHICLE 4 SECTION 1-WAY, BIMODAL ARROW
1.0000 EACH 1,750.0000 2,200.0000 25.71% 2,500.0000 42.86%
1,750.00 2,200.00 450.00 2,500.00 750.00
66  SIGNAL HEAD, PEDESTRIAN INTERNATIONAL SYMBOL, L.E.D.
4.0000 EACH 800.0000 900.0000 12.50% 800.0000 0.00%
3,200.00 3,600.00 400.00 3,200.00 0.00
67 PEDESTRIAN PUSHBUTTON ASSEMBLY
3.0000 EACH 500.0000 520.0000 4.00% 500.0000 0.00%
1,500.00 1,560.00 60.00 1,500.00 0.00
68 DETECTOR LOOP, 6FT DIAM.
4.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 980.0000 ~2.00% 1,000.0000 0.00%
4,000.00 3,920.00 -80.00 4,000.00 0.00
69  SIGNAL WIRING
L.s. 54.00 % 60.00 %
5,000.00 7,700.00 2,700.00 8,000.00 3,000.00



PAGE : 7-A

DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 04/23/2008
* % * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 08:12
PSEE JOB NO : 07A809 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : May 21 2008
CONTRACT NO : 007538 REGION NO  :1 AWARDED ON : May 27 2008
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2613
e sr 005 T e LOW BIDDER  ——=-=-= ——————m 2ND BIDDER  ———-—mm
TITLE :1-5 C.A. CAREY CORP. GRANITE NORTHWEST, INC. DBA
ﬁgg$gTD§T Tﬁo?ngﬁkEZsST - SB 1-5 537 NW LOCUST ST 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE
07A809 (REV. 4/23/08) 98027-2412
PROJECT ISSAQUAH WA 980271006 EVERETT WA 982011927
COUNTY(S) - KING CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100134 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
TRAFFIC
70  SPAN WIRE
150.0000 L.F. 6.0000 7.0000 16.67% 8.0000 33.33%
900.00 1,050.00 150.00 1,200.00 300.00
71  BOOM TRUCK AND OPERATOR FOR INSPECTOR
20.0000 HR 120.0000 210.0000 75.00 % 200.0000 66.67 %
2,400.00 4,200.00 1,800.00 4,000.00 1,600.00
72 POLE, STEEL STRAIN, TYPE IV MODIFIED
2.0000 EACH 10,000.0000 11,000.0000 10.00% 10,000.0000 0.00%
20,000.00 22,000.00 2,000.00 20,000.00 0.00
73 HANDHOLE TYPE 2
1.0000 EACH 300.0000 600.0000 100.00% 1,000.0000 233.33%
300.00 600.00 300.00 1,000.00 700.00
74 PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL
L.S. -80.22% -15.95Y%
505,678.00 100,000.00 -405,678.00 425,000.00 -80,678.00
OTHER ITEMS
75 TYPE B PROGRESS SCHEDULE
L.S. 0.00% 0.00%
10,000.00 10,000.00 0.00 10,000.00 0.00
76 CONTROLLED DENSITY FILL
340.0000 c.v. 90.0000 125.0000 38.89% 95.0000 5.56 %
30,600.00 42,500.00  11,900.00 32,300.00 1,700.00
77 STRUCTURE SURVEY ING
L.S. 105.71% 185.71%
7,000.00 14,400.00 7,400.00 20,000.00  13,000.00
78 ROADWAY SURVEYING
L.S. 18.18% -54.55%
11,000.00 13,000.00 2,000.00 5,000.00  -6,000.00
79 CEMENT CONC. SIDEWALK
620.0000 S.Y. 35.0000 58.0000 65.71% 60.0000 71.43%
21,700.00 35,960.00  14,260.00 37,200.00  15,500.00
80 CEMENT CONC. SIDEWALK RAMP TYPE 1 MODIFIED
1.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 1,550.0000 _22.50% 1,500.0000 -25.00%
2,000.00 1,550.00 -450.00 1,500.00 -500.00
81 CEMENT CONC. SIDEWALK RAMP TYPE 2 MODIFIED
3.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 1,700.0000 ~15.00% 1,500.0000 -25.00%
6,000.00 5,100.00 -900.00 4,500.00  -1,500.00



PAGE : 8-A
DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 04/23/2008
* % * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 08:12
PSEE JOB NO : 07A809 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : May 21 2008
CONTRACT NO : 007538 REGION NO  :1 AWARDED ON : May 27 2008
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2613
iy sR 005 T e LOW BIDDER  ——-mmmm  —mmmmmm 2ND BIDDER  ———-—mm
TITLE :1-5 C.A. CAREY CORP. GRANITE NORTHWEST, INC. DBA
agg$gTD§T—TSO?SEHSkEZSST - SB I-5 537 NW LOCUST ST 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE
07A809 (REV. 4/23/08) 98027-2412
PROJECT ISSAQUAH WA 980271006 EVERETT WA 982011927
COUNTY(S) - KING CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100134 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
OTHER ITEMS
82 ROADSIDE CLEANUP
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
30,000.00 30,000.00 30,000.00
83 REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
5.00 5.00 5.00
84 MINOR CHANGE
CALC 0.00% 0.00%
-1.00 -1.00 -1.00
85 SPCC PLAN
L.S. -80.00% -80.00%
5,000.00 1,000.00  -4,000.00 1,000.00  -4,000.00
86 CONSTRUCTION GEOTEXTILE FOR UNDERGROUND DRAINAGE
2.0000 S.Y. 2.0000 20.0000 900.00 % 100.0000  4,900.00%
4.00 40.00 36.00 200.00 196.00
87  VIBRATION MONITORING
L.S. 25.00 % 0.00%
20,000.00 25,000.00 5,000.00 20,000.00 0.00
88 TEMPORARY CONC. BARRIER
3480.0000 L.F. 15.0000 16.0000 6.67% 14.0000 -6.67%
52,200.00 55,680.00 3,480.00 48,720.00  -3,480.00
89 TEMPORARY IMPACT ATTENUATOR
6.0000 EACH 5,000.0000 5,000.0000 0.00% 4,200.0000 -16.00%
30,000.00 30,000.00 0.00 25,200.00  -4,800.00
BASE TOTAL $3,609,783.00 $3,749,429.00 3.87% $3,712,080.99 2.83%
ALTERNATE Al
90 REMOVING NOISE BARRIER WALL SHAFT OBSTRUCTIONS
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
17,000.00 17,000.00 17,000.00
91 DEFICIENT STRENGTH CONC. PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00%
-1.00 -1.00 -1.00
92 NOISE BARRIER WALL TYPE 4 MODIFIED (12 IN. SHAFT)
8760.0000 S.F. 60.0000 83.0000 38.33% 67.0000 11.67%
525,600.00 727,080.00 201,480.00 586,920.00  61,320.00



* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

------- LOW BIDDER  —--—-—-
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BIDS OPENED ON

------- 2ND BIDDER  ——-———-

DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
PS&E JOB NO : 07A809 REVISION NO

CONTRACT NO : 007538 REGION NO 1

VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2613

HWY SR 005

TITLE :1-5

BOSTON ST TO E SHELBY ST - SB I-5
WESTSIDE - NOISE WALLS
07A809 (REV. 4/23/08)

PROJECT
COUNTY(S)  :KING

ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT

C.A. CAREY CORP.
537 NW LOCUST ST

98027-2412
ISSAQUAH WA 980271006
CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100134

PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

GRANITE NORTHWEST, INC. DBA
1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE

EVERETT WA 982011927
CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000

PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

AWARDED ON

DATE: 04/23/2008
TIME: 08:12

: May 21 2008
: May 27 2008

ALTERNATE Al

93 NOISE BARRIER WALL TYPE 4 MODIFIED (18 IN. SHAFT)

63.0000 5.00 %
882,000.00 42,000.00

79.0000 31.67%
1,106,000.00 266,000.00

14000.0000 S.F. 60.0000
840,000.00
ALTERNATE Al TOTAL $1,382,599.00

ALTERNATE A2

94 DEFICIENT STRENGTH CONC. PRICE ADJUSTMENT

$1,626,079.00 17.61%
0.00%

0.00
0.0000 -100.00 %

0.00 1,365,600.00

0.0000 -100.00 %
0.00 -50,000.00

0.0000 -100.00 %
0.00 -65,000.00

$1,709,919.00 23.67%
0.00 %

0.00
0.0000 -100.00 %

0.00 1,365,600.00

0.0000 -100.00 %
0.00 -50,000.00

0.0000 -100.00 %
0.00 -65,000.00

CALC
-1.00
95 NOISE BARRIER WALL TYPE 4 MODIF. (7 IN. MICROPILE)
22760.0000 S.F. 60.0000
1,365,600.00
96 MICROPILE VERIFICATION LOAD TESTING
2.0000 EACH 25,000.0000
50,000.00
97 MICROPILE PROOF LOAD TESTING
13.0000 EACH 5,000.0000
65,000.00
ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL $1,480,599.00
ALTERNATE A3
98 DEFICIENT STRENGTH CONC. PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC
-1.00
99 NOISE BARRIER WALL TYPE 4 MODIF. (8-5/8 IN. MICROPILE)
22760.0000 S.F. 60.0000
1,365,600.00
100 MICROPILE VERIFICATION LOAD TESTING
2.0000 EACH 25,000.0000
50,000.00

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

0.00%
0.00

0.0000 -100.00 %
0.00 1,365,600.00

0.0000 -100.00 %
0.00 -50,000.00

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

0.00%
0.00

0.0000 -100.00 %
0.00 1,365,600.00

0.0000 -100.00 %
0.00 -50,000.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 04/23/2008
* % * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 08:12
PSEE JOB NO : 07A809 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : May 21 2008
CONTRACT NO : 007538 REGION NO  :1 AWARDED ON : May 27 2008
VERSION NO :6 WORK ORDER# : XL2613
iy sR 005 T e LOW BIDDER  ——-mmmm  —mmmmmm 2ND BIDDER  ———-—mm
TITLE :1-5 C.A. CAREY CORP. GRANITE NORTHWEST, INC. DBA
\?vgggTDET—Tﬁo?SEH\/E\/kEZSST - SB I-5 537 NW LOCUST ST 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE
07A809 (REV. 4/23/08) 98027-2412
PROJECT ISSAQUAH WA 980271006 EVERETT WA 982011927
COUNTY(S) - KING CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100134 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
ALTERNATE A3
101 MICROPILE PROOF LOAD TESTING
13.0000 EACH 5,000.0000 0.0000 -100.00 % 0.0000 -100.00 %
65,000.00 0.00 -65,000.00 0.00 -65,000.00
ALTERNATE A3 TOTAL $1,480,599.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE NO BID THIS ALTERNATE
ALTERNATE A4
102 DEFICIENT STRENGTH CONC. PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00%
-1.00 0.00 0.00
103 NOISE BARRIER WALL TYPE 4 MODIF. (9-5/8 IN. MICROPILE)
22760.0000 S.F. 60.0000 0.0000 ~100.00 % 0.0000 -100.00 %
1,365,600.00 0.00 1,365,600.00 0.00 1,365,600.00
104  MICROPILE VERIFICATION LOAD TESTING
2.0000 EACH 25,000.0000 0.0000 -100.00 % 0.0000 -100.00 %
50,000.00 0.00 -50,000.00 0.00 -50,000.00
105 MICROPILE PROOF LOAD TESTING
13.0000 EACH 5,000.0000 0.0000 -100.00 % 0.0000 -100.00 %
65,000.00 0.00 -65,000.00 0.00 -65,000.00

ALTERNATE A4 TOTAL $1,480,599.00

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

BASE TOTAL $3,609,783.00

$3,749,429.00 3.87%

$3,712,080.99 2.83%

BASE + Al CONTRACT TOTAL (A) $4,992,382.00

$5,375,508.00 7.67%

$5,421,999.99 8.61%

BASE + A2 CONTRACT TOTAL (A) $5,090,382.00

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

BASE + A3 CONTRACT TOTAL (A) $5,090,382.00

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

BASE + A4 CONTRACT TOTAL (A) $5,090,382.00

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE




PAGE :
DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
PS&E JOB NO: 07A809 * * % ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS * * =* BIDS OPENED ON:
CONTRACT NO: 007538 * % % RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT = * * x May 21 2008
TITLE: 1-5 REGION: 1

BOSTON ST TO E SHELBY ST - SB I-5
WESTSIDE - NOISE WALLS
07A809 (REV. 4/23/08)

HWY: SR 005
1 $5,375,508.00 BASE + Al C.A. CAREY CORP.
537 NW LOCUST ST
98027-2412
PO BOX 1006
ISSAQUAH, WA 980271006
2 $5,421,999.99 BASE + Al GRANITE NORTHWEST, INC. DBA

WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE
EVERETT, WA 982011927
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