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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID TABULATION REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01A057 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Mar 13 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006276 REGION NO : 1 AWARDED ON : Mar 18 2002
VERSION NO : 5 WORK ORDER# : 0L0923
HWY : SR 002 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 2
    BARCLAY CREEK BRIDGE 2/48 
REPLACEMENT
01A057 REVISED 01/17/02

WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY MOWAT CONSTRUCTION COMPANY GUY F. ATKINSON CONSTRUCTION LLC
1525 E MARINE VIEW DR 20210 142ND AVE NE 600 NACHES AVE SW #120 98055-2267

98072 PO BOX 940

PROJECT : EVERETT   WA  982011927 WOODINVILLE   WA  980721330 RENTON   WA  980570940

COUNTY(S) : SNOHOMISH CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 551010 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 046000

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

01/29/2002
14:49

DOT_RGGB05

 BR-0002(230), NH-0002(230)

PREPARATION
1 MOBILIZATION

L.S.
318,690.00 195,000.00 334,000.00 340,000.00

2 CLEARING AND GRUBBING
1.0400 ha 11,500.0000 4,500.0000 12,500.0000 7,000.0000

11,960.00 4,680.00 13,000.00 7,280.00
3 REMOVING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE

24.0000 EACH 300.0000 250.0000 150.0000 300.0000
7,200.00 6,000.00 3,600.00 7,200.00

4 REMOVING EXISTING BRIDGE NO. 2/48
L.S.

180,000.00 90,000.00 125,000.00 150,000.00
5 REMOVING EXISTING BRIDGE (DETOUR)

L.S.
40,000.00 40,000.00 60,000.00 10,000.00

6 REMOVING ASPHALT CONC. PAVEMENT
10820.0000 m2 5.0000 3.0000 3.5000 5.0000

54,100.00 32,460.00 37,870.00 54,100.00
7 REMOVING GUARDRAIL

220.0000 m 7.0000 3.0000 2.3000 3.0000
1,540.00 660.00 506.00 660.00

8 REMOVING GUARDRAIL ANCHOR
6.0000 EACH 150.0000 150.0000 130.0000 130.0000

900.00 900.00 780.00 780.00
9 REMOVING GUIDE POST

10.0000 EACH 10.0000 7.0000 15.0000 6.0000
100.00 70.00 150.00 60.00

10 REMOVING PAINT LINE
370.0000 m 4.0000 3.0000 2.0000 2.0000

1,480.00 1,110.00 740.00 740.00
11 REMOVING CHAIN LINK FENCE

598.0000 m 7.0000 4.0000 6.0000 10.0000
4,186.00 2,392.00 3,588.00 5,980.00
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GRADING
12 ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL

4580.0000 m3 12.0000 30.0000 10.8500 9.0000
54,960.00 137,400.00 49,693.00 41,220.00

13 GRAVEL BORROW INCL. HAUL
27610.0000 t 7.0000 7.0000 6.9000 11.0000

193,270.00 193,270.00 190,509.00 303,710.00
14 EMBANKMENT COMPACTION

13080.0000 m3 2.0000 3.0000 1.0000 3.0000
26,160.00 39,240.00 13,080.00 39,240.00

DRAINAGE
15 GRATE INLET TYPE 2

2.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 1,400.0000 1,500.0000 1,500.0000
4,000.00 2,800.00 3,000.00 3,000.00

16 DROP INLET TYPE 1
2.0000 EACH 2,500.0000 1,500.0000 2,500.0000 2,000.0000

5,000.00 3,000.00 5,000.00 4,000.00
17  MODIFIED PRECAST CONCRETE DRYWELL

1.0000 EACH 10,000.0000 5,000.0000 3,450.0000 2,500.0000
10,000.00 5,000.00 3,450.00 2,500.00

18 QUARRY SPALLS
16.0000 t 50.0000 120.0000 50.0000 30.0000

800.00 1,920.00 800.00 480.00
19 UNDERDRAIN PIPE 150 MM DIAM.

40.0000 m 40.0000 35.0000 35.0000 26.0000
1,600.00 1,400.00 1,400.00 1,040.00

20 DRAIN PIPE 300 MM DIAM.
162.0000 m 50.0000 85.0000 80.0000 45.0000

8,100.00 13,770.00 12,960.00 7,290.00
STORM SEWER

21 CATCH BASIN TYPE 1L
2.0000 EACH 2,500.0000 1,500.0000 850.0000 900.0000

5,000.00 3,000.00 1,700.00 1,800.00
22 CATCH BASIN TYPE 1

18.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 1,300.0000 750.0000 900.0000
18,000.00 23,400.00 13,500.00 16,200.00
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STORM SEWER
23 CATCH BASIN TYPE 2 1200 MM DIAM.

3.0000 EACH 1,800.0000 2,500.0000 2,050.0000 2,300.0000
5,400.00 7,500.00 6,150.00 6,900.00

24 TESTING STORM SEWER PIPE
479.0000 m 5.0000 10.0000 5.0000 3.0000

2,395.00 4,790.00 2,395.00 1,437.00
25 CL. IV REINF. CONC. STORM SEWER PIPE 300 MM DIAM.

21.0000 m 100.0000 124.0000 115.0000 65.0000
2,100.00 2,604.00 2,415.00 1,365.00

26 CL. V REINF. CONC. STORM SEWER PIPE 300 MM DIAM.
29.0000 m 100.0000 190.0000 115.0000 75.0000

2,900.00 5,510.00 3,335.00 2,175.00
27 SCHEDULE A STORM SEWER PIPE 300 MM DIAM.

341.0000 m 80.0000 60.0000 80.0000 65.0000
27,280.00 20,460.00 27,280.00 22,165.00

28 SCHEDULE A STORM SEWER PIPE 450 MM DIAM.
65.0000 m 90.0000 50.0000 95.0000 95.0000

5,850.00 3,250.00 6,175.00 6,175.00
29 SCHEDULE A STORM SEWER PIPE 600 MM DIAM.

23.1000 m 110.0000 200.0000 135.0000 150.0000
2,541.00 4,620.00 3,118.50 3,465.00

STRUCTURE
30 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS A INCL. HAUL

264.0000 m3 30.0000 14.0000 25.0000 20.0000
7,920.00 3,696.00 6,600.00 5,280.00

31 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A
L.S.

20,000.00 28,000.00 60,000.00 40,000.00
32 GRAVEL BACKFILL FOR WALL

230.0000 m3 40.0000 32.0000 29.8000 30.0000
9,200.00 7,360.00 6,854.00 6,900.00

33 FURNISHING AND DRIVING TIMBER TEST PILE
1.0000 EACH 3,000.0000 8,000.0000 1,500.0000 5,000.0000

3,000.00 8,000.00 1,500.00 5,000.00
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STRUCTURE
34 FURNISHING TIMBER PILING - UNTREATED

212.0000 m 25.0000 25.0000 30.0000 16.0000
5,300.00 5,300.00 6,360.00 3,392.00

35 DRIVING TIMBER PILE - UNTREATED
11.0000 EACH 500.0000 1,200.0000 2,500.0000 1,000.0000

5,500.00 13,200.00 27,500.00 11,000.00
36 EPOXY-COATED ST. REINF. BAR FOR BRIDGE

135.0000 kg 2.0000 2.0000 1.7500 2.0000
270.00 270.00 236.25 270.00

37 ST. REINF. BAR FOR BRIDGE
9420.0000 kg 1.0000 1.5000 1.2000 1.0000

9,420.00 14,130.00 11,304.00 9,420.00
38 ST. REINF. BAR FOR DETOUR

625.0000 kg 1.0000 2.0000 1.0500 1.0000
625.00 1,250.00 656.25 625.00

39 CONC. CLASS 28 FOR DETOUR
12.0000 m3 350.0000 350.0000 450.0000 600.0000

4,200.00 4,200.00 5,400.00 7,200.00
40 CONC. CLASS 28 FOR BRIDGE

145.0000 m3 350.0000 450.0000 550.0000 600.0000
50,750.00 65,250.00 79,750.00 87,000.00

41 DEFICIENT STRENGTH CONC. PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC

-2.00 -2.00 -2.00 -2.00
42 STRUCTURAL CARBON STEEL

L.S.
15,000.00 10,000.00 20,000.00 3,000.00

43 STRUCTURAL LOW ALLOY STEEL
L.S.

260,000.00 160,000.00 223,300.00 46,000.00
44 STRUCTURAL HIGH STRENGTH STEEL

L.S.
260,000.00 300,000.00 300,000.00 220,000.00

45 ROADWAY DECK - BRIDGE NO. 2/48
L.S.

200,000.00 200,000.00 175,000.00 170,000.00
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STRUCTURE
46 ROADWAY DECK  - DETOUR BRIDGE

L.S.
125,000.00 60,000.00 125,000.00 240,000.00

47 CONDUIT PIPE 53 MM DIAM.
252.0000 m 35.0000 90.0000 60.0000 40.0000

8,820.00 22,680.00 15,120.00 10,080.00
48 BRIDGE RAILING TYPE BPS

126.5000 m 150.0000 175.0000 185.0000 150.0000
18,975.00 22,137.50 23,402.50 18,975.00

49 TRAFFIC BARRIER
126.5000 m 225.0000 240.0000 350.0000 200.0000

28,462.50 30,360.00 44,275.00 25,300.00
SURFACING

50 CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE
9450.0000 t 15.0000 15.0000 13.5000 15.0000

141,750.00 141,750.00 127,575.00 141,750.00
LIQUID ASPHALT

51 ANTI-STRIPPING ADDITIVE
EST.

5,340.00 5,340.00 5,340.00 5,340.00
ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT

52 ASPHALT CONC. PAVEMENT CL. B PG 58-22
5311.0000 t 45.0000 45.0000 47.6000 47.0000

238,995.00 238,995.00 252,803.60 249,617.00
53 JOB MIX COMPLIANCE PRICE ADJUSTMENT

CALC
7,215.00 7,215.00 7,215.00 7,215.00

54 COMPACTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC

3,620.00 3,620.00 3,620.00 3,620.00
55 ASPHALT CONC. APPROACH CL. B

17.0000 t 85.0000 350.0000 65.0000 65.0000
1,445.00 5,950.00 1,105.00 1,105.00
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EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING
56 ESC LEAD

200.0000 DAY 45.0000 130.0000 0.0100 20.0000
9,000.00 26,000.00 2.00 4,000.00

57 SEEDING, FERTILIZING, AND MULCHING
1.0800 ha 2,800.0000 2,400.0000 2,000.0000 2,000.0000

3,024.00 2,592.00 2,160.00 2,160.00
58  SEED, FERTILIZE  AND MULCH - BIOSWALE AND FILTER STRIP

0.3900 ha 4,450.0000 3,500.0000 3,000.0000 3,000.0000
1,735.50 1,365.00 1,170.00 1,170.00

59 COMPOST
244.0000 m3 45.0000 60.0000 50.0000 50.0000

10,980.00 14,640.00 12,200.00 12,200.00
60 EROSION CONTROL BLANKET

1500.0000 m2 2.0000 2.0000 1.6000 2.0000
3,000.00 3,000.00 2,400.00 3,000.00

61 CHECK DAM
4.0000 m 50.0000 120.0000 30.0000 50.0000

200.00 480.00 120.00 200.00
62 STABILIZED CONSTRUCTION ENTRANCE

762.0000 m2 20.0000 20.0000 16.5000 15.0000
15,240.00 15,240.00 12,573.00 11,430.00

63 TIRE WASH
4.0000 EACH 500.0000 700.0000 1,500.0000 500.0000

2,000.00 2,800.00 6,000.00 2,000.00
64 INLET PROTECTION

22.0000 EACH 100.0000 100.0000 75.0000 160.0000
2,200.00 2,200.00 1,650.00 3,520.00

65 SILT FENCE
1325.0000 m 13.0000 9.0000 13.0000 15.0000

17,225.00 11,925.00 17,225.00 19,875.00
66 WATTLE

56.0000 m 40.0000 30.0000 20.0000 30.0000
2,240.00 1,680.00 1,120.00 1,680.00

67 TEMPORARY WATER POLLUTION/EROSION CONTROL
EST.

140,000.00 140,000.00 140,000.00 140,000.00
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EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING
68  PLANT SELECTION

332.0000 m2 12.0000 20.0000 16.0000 16.0000
3,984.00 6,640.00 5,312.00 5,312.00

69 PSIPE WESTERN HEMLOCK, 600MM HT., #2 CONT.
20.0000 EACH 12.0000 14.0000 13.0000 15.0000

240.00 280.00 260.00 300.00
70 PSIPE WESTERN RED CEDAR, 600MM HT., #2 CONT.

20.0000 EACH 12.0000 14.0000 13.0000 15.0000
240.00 280.00 260.00 300.00

71 PSIPE PACIFIC WILLOW, 900MM HT., LIVE STAKE
80.0000 EACH 10.0000 7.0000 6.0000 5.0000

800.00 560.00 480.00 400.00
72 PSIPE RED-OZIER DOGWOOD, 450MM HT., BR

2700.0000 EACH 8.0000 7.0000 6.0000 5.0000
21,600.00 18,900.00 16,200.00 13,500.00

73 PSIPE SALMONBERRY, 450MM HT., BR
1220.0000 EACH 8.0000 7.0000 6.0000 5.0000

9,760.00 8,540.00 7,320.00 6,100.00
74 PSIPE SITKA WILLOW, 900MM HT., LIVE STAKE

80.0000 EACH 10.0000 7.0000 6.0000 5.0000
800.00 560.00 480.00 400.00

75 PSIPE SNOWBERRY, 450MM HT., BR
2600.0000 EACH 8.0000 7.0000 6.0000 5.0000

20,800.00 18,200.00 15,600.00 13,000.00
76 PSIPE THIMBLEBERRY, 450MM HT., BR

1140.0000 EACH 8.0000 7.0000 6.0000 5.0000
9,120.00 7,980.00 6,840.00 5,700.00

77 PSIPE VINE MAPLE, 450MM HT., BR
1340.0000 EACH 8.0000 7.0000 6.0000 5.0000

10,720.00 9,380.00 8,040.00 6,700.00
78 PLANT ESTABLISHMENT - SECOND YEAR

EST.
11,000.00 11,000.00 11,000.00 11,000.00

79 PLANT ESTABLISHMENT - THIRD YEAR
EST.

10,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00
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EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING
80 SOIL AMENDMENT

986.0000 m3 45.0000 35.0000 32.0000 40.0000
44,370.00 34,510.00 31,552.00 39,440.00

81 BARK OR WOOD CHIP MULCH
451.0000 m3 30.0000 40.0000 43.0000 40.0000

13,530.00 18,040.00 19,393.00 18,040.00
TRAFFIC

82 EXTRUDED CURB
199.0000 m 15.0000 20.0000 15.0000 15.0000

2,985.00 3,980.00 2,985.00 2,985.00
83 BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1 - 2.7 M LONG POST

48.0000 m 100.0000 16.0000 13.9500 14.0000
4,800.00 768.00 669.60 672.00

84 BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1 - 3.3 M LONG POST
19.0000 m 110.0000 17.0000 14.9500 15.0000

2,090.00 323.00 284.05 285.00
85 BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1

388.0000 m 50.0000 14.0000 11.9500 12.0000
19,400.00 5,432.00 4,636.60 4,656.00

86 BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE 1
4.0000 EACH 1,500.0000 1,400.0000 1,200.0000 1,200.0000

6,000.00 5,600.00 4,800.00 4,800.00
87  MODIFIED BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION

1.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 1,400.0000 1,200.0000 1,200.0000
2,000.00 1,400.00 1,200.00 1,200.00

88  RESTORE BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION
1.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 550.0000 510.0000 510.0000

1,000.00 550.00 510.00 510.00
89 BEAM GUARDRAIL FLARED TERMINAL

4.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 2,000.0000 1,800.0000 1,800.0000
8,000.00 8,000.00 7,200.00 7,200.00

90 BEAM GUARDRAIL NON-FLARED TERMINAL
8.0000 EACH 2,200.0000 2,100.0000 1,950.0000 1,950.0000

17,600.00 16,800.00 15,600.00 15,600.00
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PS&E JOB NO: 01A057 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Mar 13 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006276 REGION NO : 1 AWARDED ON : Mar 18 2002
VERSION NO : 5 WORK ORDER# : 0L0923
HWY : SR 002 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 2
    BARCLAY CREEK BRIDGE 2/48 
REPLACEMENT
01A057 REVISED 01/17/02

WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY MOWAT CONSTRUCTION COMPANY GUY F. ATKINSON CONSTRUCTION LLC
1525 E MARINE VIEW DR 20210 142ND AVE NE 600 NACHES AVE SW #120 98055-2267

98072 PO BOX 940

PROJECT : EVERETT   WA  982011927 WOODINVILLE   WA  980721330 RENTON   WA  980570940

COUNTY(S) : SNOHOMISH CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 551010 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 046000

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

01/29/2002
14:49

DOT_RGGB05

 BR-0002(230), NH-0002(230)

TRAFFIC
91 BEAM GUARDRAIL ANCHOR TYPE 1

2.0000 EACH 550.0000 600.0000 530.0000 530.0000
1,100.00 1,200.00 1,060.00 1,060.00

92 REMOVING AND RESETTING BEAM GUARDRAIL
96.0000 m 50.0000 10.0000 8.9500 9.0000

4,800.00 960.00 859.20 864.00
93 TEMPORARY CONC. BARRIER

1705.0000 m 35.0000 30.0000 25.9000 30.0000
59,675.00 51,150.00 44,159.50 51,150.00

94 TEMPORARY IMPACT ATTENUATOR
7.0000 EACH 5,000.0000 5,600.0000 1,000.0000 6,000.0000

35,000.00 39,200.00 7,000.00 42,000.00
95 REPAIR IMPACT ATTENUATOR

EST.
6,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00

96 TRUCK MOUNTED IMPACT ATTENUATOR
1.0000 EACH 10,000.0000 1,800.0000 6,000.0000 18,000.0000

10,000.00 1,800.00 6,000.00 18,000.00
97 OPERATION OF TRUCK MOUNTED IMPACT ATTENUATOR

100.0000 HR 40.0000 85.0000 0.0100 40.0000
4,000.00 8,500.00 1.00 4,000.00

98 FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST
21.0000 EACH 30.0000 25.0000 23.0000 24.0000

630.00 525.00 483.00 504.00
99 PAINT LINE

4670.0000 m 0.5000 1.0000 0.8500 1.0000
2,335.00 4,670.00 3,969.50 4,670.00

100 PLASTIC DRAINAGE MARKING
14.0000 EACH 22.0000 21.0000 18.0000 18.0000

308.00 294.00 252.00 252.00
101 RECESSED PAVEMENT MARKER

0.3400 HUND 1,000.0000 2,800.0000 2,500.0000 2,500.0000
340.00 952.00 850.00 850.00

102 TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING
1060.0000 m 0.5500 1.0000 0.9000 1.0000

583.00 1,060.00 954.00 1,060.00
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* * *  BID TABULATION REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01A057 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Mar 13 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006276 REGION NO : 1 AWARDED ON : Mar 18 2002
VERSION NO : 5 WORK ORDER# : 0L0923
HWY : SR 002 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 2
    BARCLAY CREEK BRIDGE 2/48 
REPLACEMENT
01A057 REVISED 01/17/02

WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY MOWAT CONSTRUCTION COMPANY GUY F. ATKINSON CONSTRUCTION LLC
1525 E MARINE VIEW DR 20210 142ND AVE NE 600 NACHES AVE SW #120 98055-2267

98072 PO BOX 940
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COUNTY(S) : SNOHOMISH CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 892000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 551010 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 046000

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

01/29/2002
14:49

DOT_RGGB05

 BR-0002(230), NH-0002(230)

TRAFFIC
103 PERMANENT SIGNING

L.S.
840.00 1,500.00 1,000.00 3,000.00

104 CONDUIT PIPE 53 MM DIAM.
54.0000 m 40.0000 56.0000 40.0000 20.0000

2,160.00 3,024.00 2,160.00 1,080.00
105  JUNCTION BOX TYPE 1

8.0000 EACH 165.0000 800.0000 350.0000 500.0000
1,320.00 6,400.00 2,800.00 4,000.00

106  VEHICLE ARRESTING BARRIER
L.S.

5,000.00 3,500.00 10,000.00 7,000.00
107 FORCE ACCOUNT REPAIR VEHICLE ARRESTING BARRIER

EST.
1,000.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 1,000.00

108 PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN
2.0000 EACH 6,500.0000 250.0000 5,000.0000 15,500.0000

13,000.00 500.00 10,000.00 31,000.00
109 OPERATION OF PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN

9600.0000 HR 3.0000 1.0000 1.5000 2.0000
28,800.00 9,600.00 14,400.00 19,200.00

110 TYPE III BARRICADE
9.0000 EACH 200.0000 200.0000 200.0000 200.0000

1,800.00 1,800.00 1,800.00 1,800.00
111 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES

L.S.
5,000.00 5,000.00 10,000.00 20,000.00

112 TRAFFIC CONTROL LABOR
4000.0000 HR 35.0000 35.0000 35.0000 37.0000

140,000.00 140,000.00 140,000.00 148,000.00
113 TRAFFIC CONTROL VEHICLE

200.0000 DAY 50.0000 100.0000 40.0000 75.0000
10,000.00 20,000.00 8,000.00 15,000.00

114 TRAFFIC CONTROL SUPERVISOR
2000.0000 HR 32.0000 5.0000 0.0100 40.0000

64,000.00 10,000.00 20.00 80,000.00



PAGE : 11-A
WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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PS&E JOB NO: 01A057 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Mar 13 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006276 REGION NO : 1 AWARDED ON : Mar 18 2002
VERSION NO : 5 WORK ORDER# : 0L0923
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TITLE : SR 2
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01A057 REVISED 01/17/02

WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY MOWAT CONSTRUCTION COMPANY GUY F. ATKINSON CONSTRUCTION LLC
1525 E MARINE VIEW DR 20210 142ND AVE NE 600 NACHES AVE SW #120 98055-2267

98072 PO BOX 940
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DATE:
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14:49

DOT_RGGB05

 BR-0002(230), NH-0002(230)

TRAFFIC
115 CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CLASS A

20.0000 m2 150.0000 200.0000 280.0000 200.0000
3,000.00 4,000.00 5,600.00 4,000.00

OTHER ITEMS
116 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS B INCL. HAUL

234.0000 m3 20.0000 16.0000 10.0000 14.0000
4,680.00 3,744.00 2,340.00 3,276.00

117 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CLASS B
49.0000 m2 30.0000 65.0000 10.0000 11.0000

1,470.00 3,185.00 490.00 539.00
118 GRAVEL BACKFILL FOR DRAIN

12.0000 m3 50.0000 35.0000 60.0000 55.0000
600.00 420.00 720.00 660.00

119 CONTROLLED DENSITY FILL
12.6000 m3 150.0000 135.0000 140.0000 100.0000

1,890.00 1,701.00 1,764.00 1,260.00
120 PLUGGING EXISTING PIPE

1.0000 EACH 400.0000 250.0000 250.0000 300.0000
400.00 250.00 250.00 300.00

121 STRUCTURE SURVEYING
L.S.

45,000.00 8,900.00 20,000.00 20,000.00
122 ROADWAY SURVEYING

L.S.
55,000.00 16,000.00 40,000.00 20,000.00

123 CHAIN LINK FENCE TYPE 3
598.0000 m 22.0000 33.0000 19.0000 30.0000

13,156.00 19,734.00 11,362.00 17,940.00
124 END, CORNER, AND PULL POST FOR CHAIN LINK FENCE

12.0000 EACH 125.0000 200.0000 155.0000 150.0000
1,500.00 2,400.00 1,860.00 1,800.00

125 GABION CRIBBING
61.9000 m3 150.0000 300.0000 165.0000 160.0000

9,285.00 18,570.00 10,213.50 9,904.00
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 BR-0002(230), NH-0002(230)

OTHER ITEMS
126 CONNECTION TO DRAINAGE STRUCTURE

4.0000 EACH 500.0000 200.0000 200.0000 1,000.0000
2,000.00 800.00 800.00 4,000.00

127 ADJUST CATCH BASIN
2.0000 EACH 400.0000 200.0000 250.0000 300.0000

800.00 400.00 500.00 600.00
128 FORCE ACCOUNT REMOVAL OF UNEXPECTED OBSTRUCTION

EST.
1,000.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 1,000.00

129 FORCE ACCOUNT HIGH WATER REFUGE AREA
EST.

41,000.00 41,000.00 41,000.00 41,000.00
130 TRAINING

800.0000 HR 2.0000 10.0000 2.0000 1.0000
1,600.00 8,000.00 1,600.00 800.00

131 ROADSIDE CLEANUP
EST.

30,000.00 30,000.00 30,000.00 30,000.00
132 REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE

EST.
10,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00

133 SPILL PREVENTION PLAN
L.S.

2,000.00 250.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
134 MINOR CHANGE

CALC
-2.00 -2.00 -2.00 -2.00

135 FIELD OFFICE BUILDING
L.S.

30,000.00 10,000.00 15,000.00 15,000.00
136 BRIDGE APPROACH SLAB

169.3000 m2 220.0000 165.0000 150.0000 150.0000
37,246.00 27,934.50 25,395.00 25,395.00

137 LICENSED SURVEYING
L.S.

4,500.00 4,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00
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OTHER ITEMS
138  NATIVE GROWTH PROTECTION AREA SIGN

32.0000 EACH 70.0000 100.0000 100.0000 100.0000
2,240.00 3,200.00 3,200.00 3,200.00

BASE TOTAL $3,550,057.00 $3,148,674.00 $3,325,212.05 $3,407,546.00
ALTERNATE A1

139  PIER 2 STRUCTURAL EARTH WALL - ALTERNATE 1
L.S.

3,450.00 5,000.00 0.00 6,000.00

ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL $3,450.00 $5,000.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $6,000.00
ALTERNATE A2

140  PIER 2 RETAINING WALL - ALTERNATE 2
L.S.

3,250.00 0.00 15,000.00 0.00

ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL $3,250.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $15,000.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

BASE + A1 TOTAL $3,553,507.00 $3,153,674.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $3,413,546.00

BASE + A2 TOTAL $3,553,307.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $3,340,212.05 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE
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PS&E JOB NO: 01A057 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Mar 13 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006276 REGION NO : 1 AWARDED ON : Mar 18 2002
VERSION NO : 5 WORK ORDER# : 0L0923
HWY : SR 002 ------- 4TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 2
    BARCLAY CREEK BRIDGE 2/48 
REPLACEMENT
01A057 REVISED 01/17/02

F.E. WARD, INC.
2710 NE 78TH ST

PROJECT : VANCOUVER   WA  986650692

COUNTY(S) : SNOHOMISH CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 861500
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NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

01/29/2002
14:49

DOT_RGGB05

 BR-0002(230), NH-0002(230)

PREPARATION
1 MOBILIZATION

L.S.
318,690.00 355,000.00

2 CLEARING AND GRUBBING
1.0400 ha 11,500.0000 23,000.0000

11,960.00 23,920.00
3 REMOVING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE

24.0000 EACH 300.0000 150.0000
7,200.00 3,600.00

4 REMOVING EXISTING BRIDGE NO. 2/48
L.S.

180,000.00 150,000.00
5 REMOVING EXISTING BRIDGE (DETOUR)

L.S.
40,000.00 50,000.00

6 REMOVING ASPHALT CONC. PAVEMENT
10820.0000 m2 5.0000 4.0000

54,100.00 43,280.00
7 REMOVING GUARDRAIL

220.0000 m 7.0000 5.0000
1,540.00 1,100.00

8 REMOVING GUARDRAIL ANCHOR
6.0000 EACH 150.0000 95.0000

900.00 570.00
9 REMOVING GUIDE POST

10.0000 EACH 10.0000 25.0000
100.00 250.00

10 REMOVING PAINT LINE
370.0000 m 4.0000 2.0000

1,480.00 740.00
11 REMOVING CHAIN LINK FENCE

598.0000 m 7.0000 10.0000
4,186.00 5,980.00
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01/29/2002
14:49

DOT_RGGB05

 BR-0002(230), NH-0002(230)

GRADING
12 ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL

4580.0000 m3 12.0000 12.0000
54,960.00 54,960.00

13 GRAVEL BORROW INCL. HAUL
27610.0000 t 7.0000 7.0000

193,270.00 193,270.00
14 EMBANKMENT COMPACTION

13080.0000 m3 2.0000 1.0000
26,160.00 13,080.00

DRAINAGE
15 GRATE INLET TYPE 2

2.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 1,500.0000
4,000.00 3,000.00

16 DROP INLET TYPE 1
2.0000 EACH 2,500.0000 2,500.0000

5,000.00 5,000.00
17  MODIFIED PRECAST CONCRETE DRYWELL

1.0000 EACH 10,000.0000 3,400.0000
10,000.00 3,400.00

18 QUARRY SPALLS
16.0000 t 50.0000 50.0000

800.00 800.00
19 UNDERDRAIN PIPE 150 MM DIAM.

40.0000 m 40.0000 38.0000
1,600.00 1,520.00

20 DRAIN PIPE 300 MM DIAM.
162.0000 m 50.0000 87.0000

8,100.00 14,094.00
STORM SEWER

21 CATCH BASIN TYPE 1L
2.0000 EACH 2,500.0000 850.0000

5,000.00 1,700.00
22 CATCH BASIN TYPE 1

18.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 750.0000
18,000.00 13,500.00
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EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

01/29/2002
14:49

DOT_RGGB05

 BR-0002(230), NH-0002(230)

STORM SEWER
23 CATCH BASIN TYPE 2 1200 MM DIAM.

3.0000 EACH 1,800.0000 2,200.0000
5,400.00 6,600.00

24 TESTING STORM SEWER PIPE
479.0000 m 5.0000 5.0000

2,395.00 2,395.00
25 CL. IV REINF. CONC. STORM SEWER PIPE 300 MM DIAM.

21.0000 m 100.0000 115.0000
2,100.00 2,415.00

26 CL. V REINF. CONC. STORM SEWER PIPE 300 MM DIAM.
29.0000 m 100.0000 115.0000

2,900.00 3,335.00
27 SCHEDULE A STORM SEWER PIPE 300 MM DIAM.

341.0000 m 80.0000 80.0000
27,280.00 27,280.00

28 SCHEDULE A STORM SEWER PIPE 450 MM DIAM.
65.0000 m 90.0000 95.0000

5,850.00 6,175.00
29 SCHEDULE A STORM SEWER PIPE 600 MM DIAM.

23.1000 m 110.0000 135.0000
2,541.00 3,118.50

STRUCTURE
30 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS A INCL. HAUL

264.0000 m3 30.0000 25.0000
7,920.00 6,600.00

31 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A
L.S.

20,000.00 20,000.00
32 GRAVEL BACKFILL FOR WALL

230.0000 m3 40.0000 30.0000
9,200.00 6,900.00

33 FURNISHING AND DRIVING TIMBER TEST PILE
1.0000 EACH 3,000.0000 15,000.0000

3,000.00 15,000.00
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STRUCTURE
34 FURNISHING TIMBER PILING - UNTREATED

212.0000 m 25.0000 30.0000
5,300.00 6,360.00

35 DRIVING TIMBER PILE - UNTREATED
11.0000 EACH 500.0000 425.0000

5,500.00 4,675.00
36 EPOXY-COATED ST. REINF. BAR FOR BRIDGE

135.0000 kg 2.0000 1.0000
270.00 135.00

37 ST. REINF. BAR FOR BRIDGE
9420.0000 kg 1.0000 1.0000

9,420.00 9,420.00
38 ST. REINF. BAR FOR DETOUR

625.0000 kg 1.0000 1.0000
625.00 625.00

39 CONC. CLASS 28 FOR DETOUR
12.0000 m3 350.0000 478.0000

4,200.00 5,736.00
40 CONC. CLASS 28 FOR BRIDGE

145.0000 m3 350.0000 344.0000
50,750.00 49,880.00

41 DEFICIENT STRENGTH CONC. PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC

-2.00 -2.00
42 STRUCTURAL CARBON STEEL

L.S.
15,000.00 8,000.00

43 STRUCTURAL LOW ALLOY STEEL
L.S.

260,000.00 60,000.00
44 STRUCTURAL HIGH STRENGTH STEEL

L.S.
260,000.00 340,000.00

45 ROADWAY DECK - BRIDGE NO. 2/48
L.S.

200,000.00 125,000.00
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STRUCTURE
46 ROADWAY DECK  - DETOUR BRIDGE

L.S.
125,000.00 275,000.00

47 CONDUIT PIPE 53 MM DIAM.
252.0000 m 35.0000 49.0000

8,820.00 12,348.00
48 BRIDGE RAILING TYPE BPS

126.5000 m 150.0000 180.0000
18,975.00 22,770.00

49 TRAFFIC BARRIER
126.5000 m 225.0000 281.0000

28,462.50 35,546.50
SURFACING

50 CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE
9450.0000 t 15.0000 13.5000

141,750.00 127,575.00
LIQUID ASPHALT

51 ANTI-STRIPPING ADDITIVE
EST.

5,340.00 5,340.00
ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT

52 ASPHALT CONC. PAVEMENT CL. B PG 58-22
5311.0000 t 45.0000 52.0000

238,995.00 276,172.00
53 JOB MIX COMPLIANCE PRICE ADJUSTMENT

CALC
7,215.00 7,215.00

54 COMPACTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC

3,620.00 3,620.00
55 ASPHALT CONC. APPROACH CL. B

17.0000 t 85.0000 65.0000
1,445.00 1,105.00
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* * *  BID TABULATION REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01A057 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Mar 13 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006276 REGION NO : 1 AWARDED ON : Mar 18 2002
VERSION NO : 5 WORK ORDER# : 0L0923
HWY : SR 002 ------- 4TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 2
    BARCLAY CREEK BRIDGE 2/48 
REPLACEMENT
01A057 REVISED 01/17/02

F.E. WARD, INC.
2710 NE 78TH ST

PROJECT : VANCOUVER   WA  986650692

COUNTY(S) : SNOHOMISH CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 861500

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

01/29/2002
14:49

DOT_RGGB05

 BR-0002(230), NH-0002(230)

EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING
56 ESC LEAD

200.0000 DAY 45.0000 300.0000
9,000.00 60,000.00

57 SEEDING, FERTILIZING, AND MULCHING
1.0800 ha 2,800.0000 2,300.0000

3,024.00 2,484.00
58  SEED, FERTILIZE  AND MULCH - BIOSWALE AND FILTER STRIP

0.3900 ha 4,450.0000 4,400.0000
1,735.50 1,716.00

59 COMPOST
244.0000 m3 45.0000 50.0000

10,980.00 12,200.00
60 EROSION CONTROL BLANKET

1500.0000 m2 2.0000 2.0000
3,000.00 3,000.00

61 CHECK DAM
4.0000 m 50.0000 32.0000

200.00 128.00
62 STABILIZED CONSTRUCTION ENTRANCE

762.0000 m2 20.0000 18.0000
15,240.00 13,716.00

63 TIRE WASH
4.0000 EACH 500.0000 1,500.0000

2,000.00 6,000.00
64 INLET PROTECTION

22.0000 EACH 100.0000 75.0000
2,200.00 1,650.00

65 SILT FENCE
1325.0000 m 13.0000 13.0000

17,225.00 17,225.00
66 WATTLE

56.0000 m 40.0000 10.0000
2,240.00 560.00

67 TEMPORARY WATER POLLUTION/EROSION CONTROL
EST.

140,000.00 140,000.00
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* * *  BID TABULATION REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01A057 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Mar 13 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006276 REGION NO : 1 AWARDED ON : Mar 18 2002
VERSION NO : 5 WORK ORDER# : 0L0923
HWY : SR 002 ------- 4TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 2
    BARCLAY CREEK BRIDGE 2/48 
REPLACEMENT
01A057 REVISED 01/17/02

F.E. WARD, INC.
2710 NE 78TH ST

PROJECT : VANCOUVER   WA  986650692

COUNTY(S) : SNOHOMISH CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 861500

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

01/29/2002
14:49

DOT_RGGB05

 BR-0002(230), NH-0002(230)

EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING
68  PLANT SELECTION

332.0000 m2 12.0000 6.0000
3,984.00 1,992.00

69 PSIPE WESTERN HEMLOCK, 600MM HT., #2 CONT.
20.0000 EACH 12.0000 25.0000

240.00 500.00
70 PSIPE WESTERN RED CEDAR, 600MM HT., #2 CONT.

20.0000 EACH 12.0000 25.0000
240.00 500.00

71 PSIPE PACIFIC WILLOW, 900MM HT., LIVE STAKE
80.0000 EACH 10.0000 3.0000

800.00 240.00
72 PSIPE RED-OZIER DOGWOOD, 450MM HT., BR

2700.0000 EACH 8.0000 5.0000
21,600.00 13,500.00

73 PSIPE SALMONBERRY, 450MM HT., BR
1220.0000 EACH 8.0000 5.0000

9,760.00 6,100.00
74 PSIPE SITKA WILLOW, 900MM HT., LIVE STAKE

80.0000 EACH 10.0000 4.0000
800.00 320.00

75 PSIPE SNOWBERRY, 450MM HT., BR
2600.0000 EACH 8.0000 5.0000

20,800.00 13,000.00
76 PSIPE THIMBLEBERRY, 450MM HT., BR

1140.0000 EACH 8.0000 5.0000
9,120.00 5,700.00

77 PSIPE VINE MAPLE, 450MM HT., BR
1340.0000 EACH 8.0000 5.0000

10,720.00 6,700.00
78 PLANT ESTABLISHMENT - SECOND YEAR

EST.
11,000.00 11,000.00

79 PLANT ESTABLISHMENT - THIRD YEAR
EST.

10,000.00 10,000.00
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* * *  BID TABULATION REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01A057 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Mar 13 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006276 REGION NO : 1 AWARDED ON : Mar 18 2002
VERSION NO : 5 WORK ORDER# : 0L0923
HWY : SR 002 ------- 4TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 2
    BARCLAY CREEK BRIDGE 2/48 
REPLACEMENT
01A057 REVISED 01/17/02

F.E. WARD, INC.
2710 NE 78TH ST

PROJECT : VANCOUVER   WA  986650692

COUNTY(S) : SNOHOMISH CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 861500

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

01/29/2002
14:49

DOT_RGGB05

 BR-0002(230), NH-0002(230)

EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING
80 SOIL AMENDMENT

986.0000 m3 45.0000 52.0000
44,370.00 51,272.00

81 BARK OR WOOD CHIP MULCH
451.0000 m3 30.0000 32.0000

13,530.00 14,432.00
TRAFFIC

82 EXTRUDED CURB
199.0000 m 15.0000 16.0000

2,985.00 3,184.00
83 BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1 - 2.7 M LONG POST

48.0000 m 100.0000 61.0000
4,800.00 2,928.00

84 BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1 - 3.3 M LONG POST
19.0000 m 110.0000 68.0000

2,090.00 1,292.00
85 BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1

388.0000 m 50.0000 48.0000
19,400.00 18,624.00

86 BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE 1
4.0000 EACH 1,500.0000 1,400.0000

6,000.00 5,600.00
87  MODIFIED BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION

1.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 900.0000
2,000.00 900.00

88  RESTORE BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION
1.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 1,400.0000

1,000.00 1,400.00
89 BEAM GUARDRAIL FLARED TERMINAL

4.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 1,600.0000
8,000.00 6,400.00

90 BEAM GUARDRAIL NON-FLARED TERMINAL
8.0000 EACH 2,200.0000 2,000.0000

17,600.00 16,000.00
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PS&E JOB NO: 01A057 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Mar 13 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006276 REGION NO : 1 AWARDED ON : Mar 18 2002
VERSION NO : 5 WORK ORDER# : 0L0923
HWY : SR 002 ------- 4TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 2
    BARCLAY CREEK BRIDGE 2/48 
REPLACEMENT
01A057 REVISED 01/17/02

F.E. WARD, INC.
2710 NE 78TH ST

PROJECT : VANCOUVER   WA  986650692

COUNTY(S) : SNOHOMISH CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 861500

ENGR'S. EST.
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NO.
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MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
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01/29/2002
14:49

DOT_RGGB05

 BR-0002(230), NH-0002(230)

TRAFFIC
91 BEAM GUARDRAIL ANCHOR TYPE 1

2.0000 EACH 550.0000 500.0000
1,100.00 1,000.00

92 REMOVING AND RESETTING BEAM GUARDRAIL
96.0000 m 50.0000 20.0000

4,800.00 1,920.00
93 TEMPORARY CONC. BARRIER

1705.0000 m 35.0000 45.0000
59,675.00 76,725.00

94 TEMPORARY IMPACT ATTENUATOR
7.0000 EACH 5,000.0000 3,500.0000

35,000.00 24,500.00
95 REPAIR IMPACT ATTENUATOR

EST.
6,000.00 6,000.00

96 TRUCK MOUNTED IMPACT ATTENUATOR
1.0000 EACH 10,000.0000 15,000.0000

10,000.00 15,000.00
97 OPERATION OF TRUCK MOUNTED IMPACT ATTENUATOR

100.0000 HR 40.0000 30.0000
4,000.00 3,000.00

98 FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST
21.0000 EACH 30.0000 31.0000

630.00 651.00
99 PAINT LINE

4670.0000 m 0.5000 1.0000
2,335.00 4,670.00

100 PLASTIC DRAINAGE MARKING
14.0000 EACH 22.0000 18.0000

308.00 252.00
101 RECESSED PAVEMENT MARKER

0.3400 HUND 1,000.0000 2,500.0000
340.00 850.00

102 TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING
1060.0000 m 0.5500 1.0000

583.00 1,060.00
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PS&E JOB NO: 01A057 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Mar 13 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006276 REGION NO : 1 AWARDED ON : Mar 18 2002
VERSION NO : 5 WORK ORDER# : 0L0923
HWY : SR 002 ------- 4TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 2
    BARCLAY CREEK BRIDGE 2/48 
REPLACEMENT
01A057 REVISED 01/17/02

F.E. WARD, INC.
2710 NE 78TH ST

PROJECT : VANCOUVER   WA  986650692

COUNTY(S) : SNOHOMISH CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 861500

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

01/29/2002
14:49

DOT_RGGB05

 BR-0002(230), NH-0002(230)

TRAFFIC
103 PERMANENT SIGNING

L.S.
840.00 4,500.00

104 CONDUIT PIPE 53 MM DIAM.
54.0000 m 40.0000 55.0000

2,160.00 2,970.00
105  JUNCTION BOX TYPE 1

8.0000 EACH 165.0000 125.0000
1,320.00 1,000.00

106  VEHICLE ARRESTING BARRIER
L.S.

5,000.00 10,000.00
107 FORCE ACCOUNT REPAIR VEHICLE ARRESTING BARRIER

EST.
1,000.00 1,000.00

108 PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN
2.0000 EACH 6,500.0000 3,000.0000

13,000.00 6,000.00
109 OPERATION OF PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN

9600.0000 HR 3.0000 2.0000
28,800.00 19,200.00

110 TYPE III BARRICADE
9.0000 EACH 200.0000 140.0000

1,800.00 1,260.00
111 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES

L.S.
5,000.00 10,000.00

112 TRAFFIC CONTROL LABOR
4000.0000 HR 35.0000 35.0000

140,000.00 140,000.00
113 TRAFFIC CONTROL VEHICLE

200.0000 DAY 50.0000 55.0000
10,000.00 11,000.00

114 TRAFFIC CONTROL SUPERVISOR
2000.0000 HR 32.0000 36.0000

64,000.00 72,000.00
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CONTRACT NO: 006276 REGION NO : 1 AWARDED ON : Mar 18 2002
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MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

01/29/2002
14:49

DOT_RGGB05

 BR-0002(230), NH-0002(230)

TRAFFIC
115 CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CLASS A

20.0000 m2 150.0000 130.0000
3,000.00 2,600.00

OTHER ITEMS
116 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS B INCL. HAUL

234.0000 m3 20.0000 10.0000
4,680.00 2,340.00

117 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CLASS B
49.0000 m2 30.0000 10.0000

1,470.00 490.00
118 GRAVEL BACKFILL FOR DRAIN

12.0000 m3 50.0000 60.0000
600.00 720.00

119 CONTROLLED DENSITY FILL
12.6000 m3 150.0000 140.0000

1,890.00 1,764.00
120 PLUGGING EXISTING PIPE

1.0000 EACH 400.0000 250.0000
400.00 250.00

121 STRUCTURE SURVEYING
L.S.

45,000.00 20,000.00
122 ROADWAY SURVEYING

L.S.
55,000.00 25,000.00

123 CHAIN LINK FENCE TYPE 3
598.0000 m 22.0000 50.0000

13,156.00 29,900.00
124 END, CORNER, AND PULL POST FOR CHAIN LINK FENCE

12.0000 EACH 125.0000 350.0000
1,500.00 4,200.00

125 GABION CRIBBING
61.9000 m3 150.0000 165.0000

9,285.00 10,213.50
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14:49

DOT_RGGB05

 BR-0002(230), NH-0002(230)

OTHER ITEMS
126 CONNECTION TO DRAINAGE STRUCTURE

4.0000 EACH 500.0000 200.0000
2,000.00 800.00

127 ADJUST CATCH BASIN
2.0000 EACH 400.0000 250.0000

800.00 500.00
128 FORCE ACCOUNT REMOVAL OF UNEXPECTED OBSTRUCTION

EST.
1,000.00 1,000.00

129 FORCE ACCOUNT HIGH WATER REFUGE AREA
EST.

41,000.00 41,000.00
130 TRAINING

800.0000 HR 2.0000 1.0000
1,600.00 800.00

131 ROADSIDE CLEANUP
EST.

30,000.00 30,000.00
132 REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE

EST.
10,000.00 10,000.00

133 SPILL PREVENTION PLAN
L.S.

2,000.00 3,789.00
134 MINOR CHANGE

CALC
-2.00 -2.00

135 FIELD OFFICE BUILDING
L.S.

30,000.00 15,000.00
136 BRIDGE APPROACH SLAB

169.3000 m2 220.0000 180.0000
37,246.00 30,474.00

137 LICENSED SURVEYING
L.S.

4,500.00 5,000.00
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OTHER ITEMS
138  NATIVE GROWTH PROTECTION AREA SIGN

32.0000 EACH 70.0000 75.0000
2,240.00 2,400.00

BASE TOTAL $3,550,057.00 $3,518,162.50
ALTERNATE A1

139  PIER 2 STRUCTURAL EARTH WALL - ALTERNATE 1
L.S.

3,450.00 10,000.00

ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL $3,450.00 $10,000.00
ALTERNATE A2

140  PIER 2 RETAINING WALL - ALTERNATE 2
L.S.

3,250.00 5,200.00

ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL $3,250.00 $5,200.00

BASE + A1 TOTAL $3,553,507.00 $3,528,162.50

BASE + A2 TOTAL $3,553,307.00 $3,523,362.50
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PS&E JOB NO: 01A057 * * *   ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS   * * * BIDS OPENED ON:
CONTRACT NO: 006276 * * *   RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT   * * * Mar 13 2002

TITLE: SR 2
BARCLAY CREEK BRIDGE 2/48
REPLACEMENT
01A057 REVISED 01/17/02

REGION: 1

HWY: SR 002

1525 E MARINE VIEW DR
EVERETT, WA  982011927

1 $3,153,674.00 BASE + A1 WILDER CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

20210 142ND AVE NE
98072
PO BOX 1330
WOODINVILLE, WA  980721330

2 $3,340,212.05 BASE + A2 MOWAT CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

600 NACHES AVE SW #120 98055-2267
PO BOX 940
RENTON, WA  980570940

3 $3,413,546.00 BASE + A1 GUY F. ATKINSON CONSTRUCTION LLC

2710 NE 78TH ST
VANCOUVER, WA  986650692

4 $3,523,362.50 BASE + A2 F.E. WARD, INC.

2710 NE 78TH ST
VANCOUVER, WA  986650692

5 $3,528,162.50 BASE + A1 F.E. WARD, INC.


