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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 06/08/2006
* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 14:31
PS&E JOB NO : 06C503 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 12 2006
CONTRACT NO : 007182 REGION NO -3 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2006
VERSION NO :1 WORK ORDER# : XL2667
HWY .sR 005 - LOW BIDDER ————-—— ——————— 2ND BIDDER  ———-——=  —oo——oeo 3RD BIDDER ——-——--
TITLE 1-5 ACTIVE CONSTRUCTION, INC. SCARSELLA BROS., INC. ROGNLIN®S, INC.
MCALLISTER CREEK BRIDGE REPAIR 11302 BURNHAM DR NW 8404 S 196TH ST 321 W STATE ST
06C503 98332-8599 KENT WA 98032-1145 98520-6143
PROJECT - . BH-0053(923) GIG HARBOR WA 983350191 SEATTLE WA 981680697 ABERDEEN WA 985200078
COUNTY(S)  : THURSTON CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100047 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 746000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 70635C
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
PREPARATION
1 MOBILIZATION
L.S. 33.11% 44.86 % 28.50%
42,800.00 56,969.10 14,169.10 62,000.00 19,200.00 55,000.00 12,200.00
2 SACKCRETE REMOVAL
L.S. 121.82% -45.45% -45.45%
27,500.00 61,000.00 33,500.00 15,000.00 -12,500.00 15,000.00 -12,500.00
DRAINAGE
3 HEAVY LOOSE RIPRAP
365.0000 TON 45.0000 53.5000 18.89% 85.0000 88.89% 65.0000 44.44 %
16,425.00 19,527.50 3,102.50 31,025.00 14,600.00 23,725.00 7,300.00
STRUCTURE
4  SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A
L.S. -89.07% 300.00 % -68.89%
45,000.00 4,920.00 -40,080.00 180,000.00 135,000.00 14,000.00 -31,000.00
SURFACING
5 SHOULDER BALLAST
340.0000 TON 45.0000 118.0000 162.22% 70.0000 55.56 % 30.0000 -33.33%
15,300.00 40,120.00 24,820.00 23,800.00 8,500.00 10,200.00 -5,100.00
EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING
6 ESC LEAD
30.0000 DAY 125.0000 281.0000 124.80% 650.0000 420.00% 200.0000 60.00 %
3,750.00 8,430.00 4,680.00 19,500.00 15,750.00 6,000.00 2,250.00
7 EROSION/WATER POLLUTION CONTROL
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
25,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00
8  SEDIMENT CONTROL DEVICES
L.S. 112.00% -16.67% 66.67%
12,000.00 25,440.00 13,440.00 10,000.00 -2,000.00 20,000.00 8,000.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 06/08/2006
* * % BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 14:31
PS&E JOB NO : 06C503 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 12 2006
CONTRACT NO : 007182 REGION NO  :3 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2006
VERSION NO :1 WORK ORDER# : XL2667
HIY sR 0O T e LOW BIDDER ————=—= ———m—m 2ND BIDDER  —m—mmmm  —mmmmem 3RD BIDDER  —-—-——-
TITLE :1-5 ACTIVE CONSTRUCTION, INC. SCARSELLA BROS., INC. ROGNLIN®S, INC.
MCALLISTER CREEK BRIDGE REPAIR 11302 BURNHAM DR NW 8404 S 196TH ST 321 W STATE ST
06C503 98332-8599 KENT WA 98032-1145 98520-6143
PROJECT - BH-0053(923) GIG HARBOR WA 983350191 SEATTLE WA 981680697 ABERDEEN WA 985200078
COUNTY(S) - THURSTON CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100047 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 746000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 70635C
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT .DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT .DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT .DIFF.
TRAFFIC
9 PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL
L.S. -29.85% -48.53% 44.11%
19,430.00 13,630.00  -5,800.00 10,000.00  -9,430.00 28,000.00 8,570.00
OTHER ITEMS
10  COLUMN REPAIRS - BRIDGE NUMBER 5/342E
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
15,000.00 15,000.00 15,000.00 15,000.00
11  PILE REPAIRS - BRIDGE NUMBER 5/342N-E
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00
12 CONSTRUCTION ACCESS
L.S. 104.70% 200.00 % 50.00%
10,000.00 20,470.00  10,470.00 30,000.00  20,000.00 15,000.00 5,000.00
13 WORK ACCESS
L.S. -98.13% 0.00% -33.33%
30,000.00 560.00 -29,440.00 30,000.00 0.00 20,000.00 -10,000.00
14 ROADSIDE CLEANUP
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00
15 REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE
EST. 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00
16 MINOR CHANGE
CALC 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
-1.00 -1.00 -1.00 ~1.00
17 SPCC PLAN
L.S. -2.78% 386.11% 177.78%
720.00 700.00 ~20.00 3,500.00 2,780.00 2,000.00 1,280.00
18  HIGH VISIBILITY FENCE
470.0000 L.F. 10.0000 3.0000 ~70.00% 4.0000 -60.00% 10.0000 0.00%
4,700.00 1,410.00  -3,290.00 1,880.00  -2,820.00 4,700.00 0.00
BASE TOTAL $292,629.00 $318,180.60 8.73% $481,709.00 64.61% $278,629.00 -4.78%
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DATE: 06/08/2006

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 14:31
PS&E JOB NO : 06C503 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 12 2006
CONTRACT NO : 007182 REGION NO  :3 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2006
VERSION NO :1 WORK ORDER# : XL2667
HiY B LOW BIDDER ————=—= ———m—m 2ND BIDDER  ————--m  ———mm o 3RD BIDDER ---—-—-
TITLE :1-5 ACTIVE CONSTRUCTION, INC. SCARSELLA BROS., INC. ROGNLIN®S, INC.
MCALLISTER CREEK BRIDGE REPAIR 11302 BURNHAM DR NW 8404 S 196TH ST 321 W STATE ST
06C503 98332-8599 KENT WA 98032-1145 98520-6143
PROJECT - BH-0053(923) GIG HARBOR WA 983350191 SEATTLE WA 981680697 ABERDEEN WA 985200078
COUNTY(S) - THURSTON CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100047 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 746000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 70635C
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT .DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
ALTERNATE Al
19  COLUMN JACKETING - BRIDGE NO. 5/342E Al
L.S. 22.17% -100.00 % 170.61%
115,000.00 140,500.00  25,500.00 0.00 -115,000.00 311,200.00 196,200.00
20  COLUMN JACKETING - BRIDGE NO. 5/342N-E Al
L.S. 170.39% -100.00 % 270.59 %
51,000.00 137,900.00  86,900.00 0.00 -51,000.00 189,000.00 138,000.00
ALTERNATE Al TOTAL $166,000.00 $278,400.00 67.71% NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $500,200.00 201.33%
ALTERNATE A2
21  COLUMN JACKETING - BRIDGE NO. 5/342E A2
L.S. 125.33% -26.92% 103.08 %
130,000.00 292,930.00 162,930.00 95,000.00 -35,000.00 264,000.00 134,000.00
22 COLUMN JACKETING - BRIDGE NO. 5/342N-E A2
L.S. 103.08 % -30.77% 135.69 %
65,000.00 132,000.00  67,000.00 45,000.00 -20,000.00 153,200.00  88,200.00
ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL $195,000.00 $424,930.00 117.91% $140,000.00 -28.21% $417,200.00 113.95 %
BASE TOTAL $292,629.00 $318,180.60 8.73% $481,709.00 64.61% $278,629.00 —4.78%
BASE + ALl CONTRACT TOTAL (A) $458,629.00 $596,580.60 30.08% NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $778,829.00 69.82%
BASE + A2 CONTRACT TOTAL (A) $487,629.00 $743,110.60 52.39% $621,709.00 27.50% $695,829.00 42.70%
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PS&E JOB NO : 06C503
CONTRACT NO : 007182

REVISION NO :
REGION NO -3

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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DATE: 06/08/2006
TIME: 14:31

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 12 2006

AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2006

VERSION NO :1 WORK ORDER# : XL2667
HWY -sR 005 e 4TH BIDDER  ——=-——= == 5TH BIDDER ———--—-
TITLE 1-5 QUIGG BROS., INC. TRI-STATE CONSTRUCTION, INC.
MCALLISTER CREEK BRIDGE REPAIR 819 W STATE ST 350 - 106TH AVE NE
06C503 98520-5934 98004-5732
PROJECT -, BH-0053(923) ABERDEEN WA 985200281 BELLEVUE WA 980093686
COUNTY(S)  : THURSTON CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 680000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 829961
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
PREPARATION
1 MOBILIZATION
L.S. 75.23% 86.92%
42,800.00 75,000.00 32,200.00 80,000.00 37,200.00
2 SACKCRETE REMOVAL
L.S. -72.73% 9.09%
27,500.00 7,500.00 -20,000.00 30,000.00 2,500.00
DRAINAGE
3 HEAVY LOOSE RIPRAP
365.0000 TON 45.0000 65.0000 44 _44% 75.0000 66.67%
16,425.00 23,725.00 7,300.00 27,375.00 10,950.00
STRUCTURE
4  SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A
L.S. 511.11% 744 .44 %
45,000.00 275,000.00 230,000.00 380,000.00 335,000.00
SURFACING
5 SHOULDER BALLAST
340.0000 TON 45.0000 60.0000 33.33% 45.0000 0.00%
15,300.00 20,400.00 5,100.00 15,300.00 0.00
EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING
6 ESC LEAD
30.0000 DAY 125.0000 100.0000 -20.00% 10.0000 -92.00%
3,750.00 3,000.00 -750.00 300.00 -3,450.00
7 EROSION/WATER POLLUTION CONTROL
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
25,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00
8  SEDIMENT CONTROL DEVICES
L.S. 108.33% 25.00%
12,000.00 25,000.00 13,000.00 15,000.00 3,000.00
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PS&E JOB NO : 06C503
CONTRACT NO : 007182

REVISION NO :
REGION NO -3
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DATE: 06/08/2006
TIME: 14:31

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 12 2006

AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2006

VERSION NO :1 WORK ORDER# : XL2667
HWY -sR 005 e 4TH BIDDER ——————= ————e—— 5TH BIDDER ———--—-
TITLE 1-5 QUIGG BROS., INC. TRI-STATE CONSTRUCTION, INC.
MCALLISTER CREEK BRIDGE REPAIR 819 W STATE ST 350 - 106TH AVE NE
06C503 98520-5934 98004-5732
PROJECT -, BH-0053(923) ABERDEEN WA 985200281 BELLEVUE WA 980093686
COUNTY(S)  : THURSTON CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 680000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 829961
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT _DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
TRAFFIC
9 PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL
L.S. -48.53% 2.93%
19,430.00 10,000.00 -9,430.00 20,000.00 570.00
OTHER ITEMS
10 COLUMN REPAIRS - BRIDGE NUMBER 5/342E
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
15,000.00 15,000.00 15,000.00
11  PILE REPAIRS - BRIDGE NUMBER 5/342N-E
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00
12  CONSTRUCTION ACCESS
L.S. 50.00 % 50.00 %
10,000.00 15,000.00 5,000.00 15,000.00 5,000.00
13 WORK ACCESS
L.S. -33.33% -33.33%
30,000.00 20,000.00 -10,000.00 20,000.00 -10,000.00
14 ROADSIDE CLEANUP
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00
15 REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
5.00 5.00 5.00
16 MINOR CHANGE
CALC 0.00% 0.00%
-1.00 -1.00 -1.00
17 SPCC PLAN
L.S. 38.89% 594 _44 %
720.00 1,000.00 280.00 5,000.00 4,280.00
18  HIGH VISIBILITY FENCE
470.0000 L.F. 10.0000 6.0000 -40.00% 10.0000 0.00%
4,700.00 2,820.00 -1,880.00 4,700.00 0.00
BASE TOTAL $292,629.00 $543,449.00 85.71% $677,679.00 131.58%



DOT_RGGBO1

PS&E JOB NO : 06C503
CONTRACT NO : 007182

REVISION NO :
REGION NO -3

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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DATE: 06/08/2006
TIME: 14:31

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 12 2006
AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2006

VERSION NO :1 WORK ORDER# : XL2667
HIY sR 0O T e 4TH BIDDER  —-----= ——--——- 5TH BIDDER  -------
TITLE 11-5 QUIGG BROS., INC. TRI-STATE CONSTRUCTION, INC.
MCALLISTER CREEK BRIDGE REPAIR 819 W STATE ST 350 — 106TH AVE NE
06C503 98520-5934 98004-5732
PROJECT - BH-0053(923) ABERDEEN WA 985200281 BELLEVUE WA 980093686
COUNTY(S) - THURSTON CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 680000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 829961
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT — AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT ~ AMT.DIFF.
ALTERNATE Al
19  COLUMN JACKETING - BRIDGE NO. 5/342E Al
L.S. 4.35% 0.00%
115,000.00 120,000.00  5,000.00 115,000.00 0.00
20  COLUMN JACKETING - BRIDGE NO. 5/342N-E Al
L.S. 115.69% 76.47 %
51,000.00 110,000.00  59,000.00 90,000.00  39,000.00
ALTERNATE Al TOTAL $166,000.00 $230,000.00 38.55% $205,000.00 23.49%
ALTERNATE A2
21 COLUMN JACKETING - BRIDGE NO. 5/342E A2
L.S. ~100.00% 65.38%
130,000.00 0.00 -130,000.00 215,000.00  85,000.00
22 COLUMN JACKETING - BRIDGE NO. 5/342N-E A2
L.S. ~100.00 % 0.00%
65,000.00 0.00 -65,000.00 65,000.00 0.00
ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL $195,000.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $280,000.00 43.59%
BASE TOTAL $292,629.00 $543,449.00 85.71% $677,679.00 131.58%
BASE + AL CONTRACT TOTAL (A) $458,629.00 $773,449.00 68.64% $882,679.00 92.46%
BASE + A2 CONTRACT TOTAL (A) $487,629.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $957,679.00 96.40%




DOT_RGGBO1
PS&E JOB NO:

CONTRACT NO:
TITLE:

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

06C503 * % % ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS * * * BIDS OPENED ON-
007182 # % %  RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT  * * = Jul 12 2006
1-5 REGION: 3
MCALLISTER CREEK BRIDGE REPAIR
06C503
HWY: SR 005
$596,580.60 BASE + Al ACTIVE CONSTRUCTION, INC.

11302 BURNHAM DR NW

98332-8599

PO BOX 191

GIG HARBOR, WA 983350191

$621,709.00 BASE + A2 SCARSELLA BROS., INC.
8404 S 196TH ST
KENT WA 98032-1145
PO BOX 68697
SEATTLE, WA 981680697

$695,829.00 BASE + A2 ROGNLIN™S, INC.
321 W STATE ST
98520-6143
PO BOX 307
ABERDEEN, WA 985200078

$743,110.60 BASE + A2 ACTIVE CONSTRUCTION, INC.
11302 BURNHAM DR NW
98332-8599
PO BOX 191
GIG HARBOR, WA 983350191

$773,449.00 BASE + Al QUIGG BROS., INC.
819 W STATE ST
98520-5934
PO BOX 1707

ABERDEEN, WA 985200281

$778,829.00 BASE + Al ROGNLIN™S, INC.
321 W STATE ST
98520-6143
PO BOX 307
ABERDEEN, WA 985200078

$882,679.00 BASE + Al TRI-STATE CONSTRUCTION, INC.

350 - 106TH AVE NE
98004-5732

PO BOX 3686

BELLEVUE, WA 980093686
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PS&E JOB NO:

CONTRACT NO:
TITLE:

06C503
007182
1-5

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* Kk K

*

MCALLISTER CREEK BRIDGE REPAIR

06C503

$957,679.00

*

*

ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS
RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT

BASE + A2

HWY: SR 005

e BIDS OPENED ON:
ok Jul 12 2006
REGION: 3

TRI-STATE CONSTRUCTION, INC.

350 - 106TH AVE NE
98004-5732

PO BOX 3686

BELLEVUE, WA 980093686
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