

PS&E JOB NO : 19B009 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 009387 REGION NO : 2
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : 000000
 HWY : SR 155
 TITLE : SR155
 GRAND COULEE BRIDGE
 UPGRADE ILLUMINATION
 19B009
 PROJECT : STP-0155(021)
 COUNTY(S) : DOUGLAS, OKANOGAN

BIDS OPENED ON : Feb 27 2019
 AWARDED ON : Mar 6 2019

----- LOW BIDDER -----	----- 2ND BIDDER -----	----- 3RD BIDDER -----
COLVICO, INC. 2812 N PITTSBURG ST SPOKANE WA 99207-4854 SPOKANE WA 992202682 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100025	NORTHEAST ELECTRIC, LLC 1780 DOWN RIVER DR WOODLAND WA 986749699 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100520	NEPPEL ELECTRICAL & CONTROLS, 4703 KELLY PLACE MOSES LAKE WA 988374306 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100780

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		2ND BIDDER		3RD BIDDER			
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.		
PREPARATION										
1	MOBILIZATION	L.S.	41,000.00	-3.94 %	39,386.00	-1,614.00	30,000.00	-26.83 %	25,000.00	-39.02 %
TRAFFIC										
2	ILLUMINATION SYSTEM 1	L.S.	200,000.00	-26.70 %	146,600.00	-53,400.00	268,000.00	34.00 %	350,000.00	75.00 %
3	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL	L.S.	73,300.00	-25.50 %	54,610.00	-18,690.00	80,000.00	9.14 %	50,000.00	-31.79 %
OTHER ITEMS										
4	REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE	EST.	5.00	0.00 %	5.00		5.00	0.00 %	5.00	0.00 %
5	MINOR CHANGE	CALC	-1.00	0.00 %	-1.00		-1.00	0.00 %	-1.00	0.00 %
6	AGGREGATE COMPLIANCE PRICE ADJUSTMENT	CALC	-1.00	0.00 %	-1.00		-1.00	0.00 %	-1.00	0.00 %
7	SPCC PLAN	L.S.	700.00	112.43 %	1,487.00	787.00	2,500.00	257.14 %	1,500.00	114.29 %
CONTRACT TOTAL			\$315,003.00	-23.15%	\$242,086.00		\$380,503.00	20.79%	\$426,503.00	35.40%

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 01/03/2019

*** BID CHECK REPORT ***

TIME: 15:33

PS&E JOB NO : 19B009 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 009387 REGION NO : 2
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : 000000
 HWY : SR 155
 TITLE : SR155
 GRAND COULEE BRIDGE
 UPGRADE ILLUMINATION
 19B009
 PROJECT : STP-0155(021)
 COUNTY(S) : DOUGLAS, OKANOGAN

BIDS OPENED ON : Feb 27 2019
 AWARDED ON : Mar 6 2019

----- LOW BIDDER ----- 2ND BIDDER ----- 3RD BIDDER -----
 COLVICO, INC. NORTHEAST ELECTRIC, LLC NEPPEL ELECTRICAL & CONTROLS,
 2812 N PITTSBURG ST 1780 DOWN RIVER DR 4703 KELLY PLACE
 SPOKANE WA 99207-4854
 SPOKANE WA 992202682 WOODLAND WA 986749699 MOSES LAKE WA 988374306
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100025 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100520 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100780

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		2ND BIDDER		3RD BIDDER	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
BASE TOTAL			\$315,003.00	-23.15%	\$380,503.00	20.79%	\$426,503.00	35.40%

PS&E JOB NO : 19B009 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 009387 REGION NO : 2
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : 000000
 HWY : SR 155
 TITLE : SR155
 GRAND COULEE BRIDGE
 UPGRADE ILLUMINATION
 19B009
 PROJECT : STP-0155(021)
 COUNTY(S) : DOUGLAS, OKANOGAN

BIDS OPENED ON : Feb 27 2019
 AWARDED ON : Mar 6 2019

----- 4TH BIDDER -----
 TRANSPORTATION SYSTEMS, INC.
 6917 166TH AVE E
 SUMNER WA 983902908
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100854

CONTRACTOR NUMBER :
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER :

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT					
PREPARATION									
1	MOBILIZATION	L.S.	41,000.00	45,000.00	9.76 % 4,000.00	0.00	-100.00 %		
TRAFFIC									
2	ILLUMINATION SYSTEM 1	L.S.	200,000.00	392,997.00	96.50 % 192,997.00	0.00	-100.00 %		
3	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL	L.S.	73,300.00	50,000.00	-31.79 % -23,300.00	0.00	-100.00 %		
OTHER ITEMS									
4	REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE	EST.	5.00	5.00	0.00 %	0.00	0.00 %		
5	MINOR CHANGE	CALC	-1.00	-1.00	0.00 %	0.00	0.00 %		
6	AGGREGATE COMPLIANCE PRICE ADJUSTMENT	CALC	-1.00	-1.00	0.00 %	0.00	0.00 %		
7	SPCC PLAN	L.S.	700.00	4,000.00	471.43 % 3,300.00	0.00	-100.00 %		
CONTRACT TOTAL			\$315,003.00	\$492,000.00	56.19%		\$0.00		

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 01/03/2019

*** BID CHECK REPORT ***

TIME: 15:33

PS&E JOB NO : 19B009 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 009387 REGION NO : 2
 VERSION NO : 2 WORK ORDER# : 000000
 HWY : SR 155
 TITLE : SR155
 GRAND COULEE BRIDGE
 UPGRADE ILLUMINATION
 19B009
 PROJECT : STP-0155(021)
 COUNTY(S) : DOUGLAS, OKANOGAN

BIDS OPENED ON : Feb 27 2019
 AWARDED ON : Mar 6 2019

----- 4TH BIDDER -----
 TRANSPORTATION SYSTEMS, INC.
 6917 166TH AVE E
 SUMNER WA 983902908
 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100854 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : CONTRACTOR NUMBER :

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT					
BASE TOTAL			\$315,003.00	\$492,000.00	56.19%	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE