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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 02/08/2022
* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * = TIME: 13:04

PS&E JOB NO : 21Y006 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Feb 16 2022
CONTRACT NO : 009760 REGION NO 15 AWARDED ON : Mar 3 2022
VERSION NO :3 WORK ORDER# : XL5392
Y SR 305 e LOW BIDDER  ————-—— —————n 2ND BIDDER  ——---—-
TITLE -US 395 MASSANA CONSTRUCTION, INC. WM. WINKLER COMPANY

PASCO -FLAMINGO MOBILE HOME 4810 PT FOSDICK DR #237 5516 N STARR RD

Z?\R(SO(’\S‘OISE WALLS 99025-8609
PROJECT - NHPP-0395(099) GIG HARBOR WA 983351711 NEWMAN LAKE WA 990250430
COUNTY(S)  :FRANKLIN CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100064 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100715

ENGR"S. EST.

ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

PREPARAT ION
1 MOBILIZATION

L.S. 90.63% -2.49%
131,144.70 250,000.00 118,855.30 127,883.00 -3,261.70
2 CLEARING AND GRUBBING
L.S. 96.08 % 29.41%
15,300.00 30,000.00 14,700.00 19,800.00 4,500.00
3 REMOVAL OF STRUCTURES AND OBSTRUCTIONS
L.S. 420.00% -79.30%
5,000.00 26,000.00 21,000.00 1,035.00 -3,965.00
4 REMOVING NOISE BARRIER WALL SHAFT OBSTRUCTIONS
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
15,000.00 15,000.00 15,000.00
GRADING
5 ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL
479.0000 C.Y. 70.0000 70.0000 0.00% 153.0000 118.57 %
33,530.00 33,530.00 0.00 73,287.00 39,757.00
6 DELETED ITEM
0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00 %
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
7 GRAVEL BORROW INCL. HAUL
675.0000 TON 40.0000 54.0000 35.00% 136.0000 240.00 %
27,000.00 36,450.00 9,450.00 91,800.00 64,800.00
8 EMBANKMENT COMPACTION
625.0000 C.Y. 9.0000 13.0000 44 44 % 37.0000 311.11%
5,625.00 8,125.00 2,500.00 23,125.00 17,500.00
DRAINAGE
9 GRATE INLET TYPE 2
1.0000 EACH 4,000.0000 6,500.0000 62.50% 9,864.0000 146.60 %
4,000.00 6,500.00 2,500.00 9,864.00 5,864.00
10 LIGHT LOOSE RIPRAP
2760.0000 TON 40.0000 65.0000 62.50% 160.5000 301.25%
110,400.00 179,400.00 69,000.00 442,980.00 332,580.00

11 QUARRY SPALLS
16.0000 TON 80.0000 75.0000 -6.25% 246.5000 208.12 %
1,280.00 1,200.00 -80.00 3,944.00 2,664.00
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DATE: 02/08/2022

* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * = TIME: 13:04
PS&E JOB NO : 21Y006 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : Feb 16 2022
CONTRACT NO : 009760 REGION NO 15 AWARDED ON : Mar 3 2022
VERSION NO :3 WORK ORDER# : XL5392
Y SR 305 e LOW BIDDER  ————-—— —————n 2ND BIDDER  ——---—-
TITLE -US 395 MASSANA CONSTRUCTION, INC. WM. WINKLER COMPANY
EQEEONBTEQM&QEBSMOBILE HOME 4810 PT FOSDICK DR #237 5516 N STARR RD
21Y006 99025-8609
PROJECT - NHPP-0395(099) GIG HARBOR WA 983351711 NEWMAN LAKE WA 990250430
COUNTY(S)  :FRANKLIN CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100064 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100715
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
DRAINAGE
12 UNDERDRAIN PIPE 6 IN. DIAM.
300.0000 L.F. 30.0000 35.0000 16.67% 74.0000 146.67 %
9,000.00 10,500.00 1,500.00 22,200.00 13,200.00
13 SCHEDULE A CULV. PIPE 12 IN. DIAM.
25.0000 L.F. 70.0000 165.0000 135.71% 4440000 534.29 %
1,750.00 4,125.00 2,375.00 11,100.00 9,350.00
STORM SEWER
14 CATCH BASIN TYPE 1
1.0000 EACH 2,500.0000 3,800.0000 52.00% 8,631.0000 245 .24 %
2,500.00 3,800.00 1,300.00 8,631.00 6,131.00
EROSION CONTROL AND ROADSIDE PLANTING
15 EROSION CONTROL AND WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION
L.S. 316.67% -43.02 %
18,000.00 75,000.00 57,000.00 10,257.00 -7,743.00
16 SEEDING AND MULCHING
0.0800 ACRE 6,000.0000 14,550.0000 142 .50 % 18,300.0000 205.00 %
480.00 1,164.00 684.00 1,464.00 984.00
17 MEDIUM COMPOST
0.0800 ACRE 30,000.0000 13,250.0000 -55.83% 16,500.0000 -45.00 %
2,400.00 1,060.00 -1,340.00 1,320.00 -1,080.00
TRAFFIC
18 PERMANENT SIGNING
L.S. 2.60% -70.39%
13,000.00 13,338.00 338.00 3,849.00 -9,151.00
19 PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL
L.S. 16.36% -12.93 %
150,000.00 174,544 .00 24,544 .00 130,606.00 -19,394.00
20 CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CLASS A
88.0000 S.F. 25.0000 50.0000 100.00 % 1.0000 -96.00 %
2,200.00 4,400.00 2,200.00 88.00 -2,112.00



DOT_RGGBO1
PS&E JOB NO : 21Y006 REVISION NO
CONTRACT NO : 009760 REGION NO :5
VERSION NO :3 WORK ORDER# : XL5392
HWY SR 395
TITLE :US 395

PASCO -FLAMINGO MOBILE HOME

PARK NOISE WALLS

21Y006
PROJECT = NHPP-0395(099)

COUNTY(S)  :FRANKLIN

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
* * * BID CHECK REPORT

_______ LOW BIDDER

MASSANA CONSTRUCTION,

* K* K

INC.

4810 PT FOSDICK DR #237

GIG HARBOR WA 983351711

CONTRACTOR NUMBER :

100064

PAGE : 4-A

DATE: 02/08/2022
TIME: 13:04

BIDS OPENED ON : Feb 16 2022

------- 2ND BIDDER — ——-———-

WM. WINKLER COMPANY
5516 N STARR RD

99025-8609
NEWMAN LAKE WA 990250430
CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100715

AWARDED ON : Mar 3 2022

ENGR™S. EST.
I1TEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
OTHER ITEMS
21 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS B INCL. HAUL
65.0000 C.y. 40.0000 100.0000 150.00 % 173.0000 332.50 %
2,600.00 6,500.00 3,900.00 11,245.00 8,645.00
22 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CLASS B
82.0000 S.F. 2.7500 1.0000 -63.64 % 123.5000 4,390.91%
225.50 82.00 -143.50 10,127.00 9,901.50
23 GRAVEL BACKFILL FOR DRAIN
23.0000 C.y. 100.0000 120.0000 20.00% 173.0000 73.00 %
2,300.00 2,760.00 460.00 3,979.00 1,679.00
24 STRUCTURE SURVEYING
L.S. 50.00% 99.01 %
10,000.00 15,000.00 5,000.00 19,901.00 9,901.00
25 CLEANING EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE
L.S. 400.00 % 1,774.20%
500.00 2,500.00 2,000.00 9,371.00 8,871.00
26 ROADSIDE CLEANUP
EST. 0.00% 0.00%
15,000.00 15,000.00 15,000.00
27 REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE
EST. 0.00% 0.00 %
5.00 5.00 5.00
28 MINOR CHANGE
CALC 0.00% 0.00%
-1.00 -1.00 -1.00
29 AGGREGATE COMPLIANCE PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00 %
-1.00 -1.00 -1.00
30 SPCC PLAN
L.S. 0.00% -16.50 %
2,000.00 2,000.00 0.00 1,670.00 -330.00
31 CONSTRUCTION GEOTEXTILE FOR UNDERGROUND DRAINAGE
180.0000 S.Y. 6.0000 7.0000 16.67% 49.3000 721.67 %
1,080.00 1,260.00 180.00 8,874.00 7,794.00
BASE TOTAL $581,318.20 $919,241.00 58.13% $1,078,403.00 85.51% %
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 02/08/2022
* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * = TIME: 13:04
PS&E JOB NO : 21Y006 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Feb 16 2022
CONTRACT NO : 009760 REGION NO 15 AWARDED ON : Mar 3 2022
VERSION NO :3 WORK ORDER# : XL5392 Lo BIDDER ND BIDDER
HWY :SR35 . Tmmmmmm AR RAEEER mmmmmmm mmmmmmm A RAEEER . T
TITLE -US 395 MASSANA CONSTRUCTION, INC. WM. WINKLER COMPANY
EQEEONBTEQM;VQEBSMOB'LE HOME 4810 PT FOSDICK DR #237 5516 N STARR RD
21Y006 99025-8609
PROJECT - NHPP-0395(099) GIG HARBOR WA 983351711 NEWMAN LAKE WA 990250430
COUNTY(S)  :FRANKLIN CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100064 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100715
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
ALTERNATE Al
32 NOISE BARRIER WALL TYPE 11 MODIFIED
19550.0000 S.F. 65.0000 98.4600 51.48% 0.0000 -100.00 %
1,270,750.00 1,924,893.00 654,143.00 0.00 1,270,750.00
ALTERNATE Al TOTAL $1,270,750.00 $1,924,893.00 51.48% NO BID THIS ALTERNATE
ALTERNATE A2
33 NOISE BARRIER WALL TYPE 20
19550.0000 S.F. 50.0000 0.0000 -100.00 % 180.0000 260.00 %
977,500.00 0.00 -977,500.00 3,519,000.00 2,541,500.00
ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL $977,500.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $3,519,000.00 260.00 %
BASE TOTAL $581,318.20 $919,241.00 58.13% $1,078,403.00 85.51%
BASE + Al CONTRACT TOTAL (A) $1,852,068.20 $2,844,134_.00 53.57% NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

BASE + A2 CONTRACT TOTAL (A) $1,558,818.20 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $4,597,403.00 194.93%




DOT_RGGBO1
PS&E JOB NO: 21Y006

CONTRACT NO: 009760

TITLE: US 395
PASCO -FLAMINGO MOBILE HOME
PARK NOISE WALLS
21Y006

1 $2,844,134.00

2 $4,597,403.00
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS
* * *  RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT

BASE + Al

BASE + A2

HWY: SR 395

el BIDS OPENED ON:
el Feb 16 2022
REGION: 5

MASSANA CONSTRUCTION, INC.

4810 PT FOSDICK DR #237
GIG HARBOR, WA 983351711

WM. WINKLER COMPANY

5516 N STARR RD

99025-8609

PO BOX 430

NEWMAN LAKE, WA 990250430
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